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Introduction 

As the 21st century looms, those in 
government charged with the 
responsibility of making regulation are 
under increasing pressure. This is 
reflected In the observation that "[tlo some 
business spokespeople, government 
interference in the marketplace is 
regarded as the embodiment of evil. 
Others adopt a more flexible approach, 
objecting strenuously to some forms of 
rayulaliur~, bul tularatiny, illdeed, 
embracing, those forms of government 
involvement which happen to foster their 
own business interests".' 

There is increasing pressure to improve 
the business environment by reducing 
costs and other impediments. There are 
increasing demands that regulations be 
"efficient and effective". In response, 
governments (or, at least, those that wish 
to be elected and re-elected) increasingly 
pledge that they will "cut red tape". 
However, there is a general business 
ignorance of what those in government 
are doing to make the regulatory process 
more efficient. 

- 
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The best publicised project is the National 
Performance Review of the United States 
of America, chaired by Vice-President AI 
Gore, with its objective of "re-inventing 
government". However, even this project 
receives relatively little credit, leading to 
the title of the Vice-President's September 
1996 report, "The Best Kept Secrets in 
~overnmeni ' .~  

This is not true in my home jurisdiction of 
Victoria (Australia) where the Executive 
and the Parliament are actively involved in 
innovative approaches to the problems 
that face both regulators and the 
regulated In the late 20th century. 

After eight years service on a 
parliamentary committee charged with 
scrutiny of regulation, I believe it is vital 
that parliamentary committees remain 
abreast of the multi-disciplinary work of 
regulatory reform and ensure that reform 
is not a guise for avoiding parliamentary 
and public scrutiny. 

Thus, in this paper, I will focus on new 
developments in regulatory reform, 
including negotiated rulemaking, cost- 
benefit analysis and especially the 
concept of regulatory flexibility. I will touch 
on developments in rule-making in Victoria 
(and in Australia generally) to 
demonstrate that, rather than being 
swamped by the waves of criticism, 
regulators in Victoria are well-placed to 
ride those waves. This is because we 
have already implemented reforms 
including: 

W mandatory cost-benefit analysis; 

W mandatory consultation with interest 
groups and the general public; 
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ten year sunset clauses; 

a strong system of review by an all- 
party parliamentary committee with 
disallowance by either House of the 
(bicameral) Parliament. 

However, while much has been achieved, 
we still grapple with the assessment of the 
costs and benefits of regulation, how such 
costs arc changing over timc, and what 
effect increasing complexity has on 
compliance. 

l do not claim that Victoria has cornered 
the market on regulatory innovation. In 
May 1996, the NSW Government issued a 
Green Paper entitled Regulatory 
innovation: Regulation for results. In that 
paper, the NSW Government opened up 
discussion on the concept of "regulator), 
innovation strategies", the common thread 
of which is expressed to be "that they 
create room for businesses to influence 
the means by which they will satisfy the 
objectives~of the regulation".3 The paper 
canvasses various alternatives to the 
current system of regulation, including 
"performance based regulation", 
"negotiated rule making", "class 
exemptions" for small business, 
"regulatory flexibility" and "third party 
certification". 

This is further evidence of the fact that 
governments and parllaments in Australia 
are aware of the demands of those being 
regulated, the pressures these demands 
place on the regulators, and also of the 
alternative compliance mechanisms that 
are available. 

"Governments are not omnicompetent" 

I believe currcnt progress in regulatory 
reform is more than the knee-jerk reaction 
of politicians to the self-interested 
demands of business. Rather, 
governments must look at ways of 
improving their approach to regulation 
because regulation is increasingly 
believed to be beyond the capacity of 

governments to manage on their own (and 
from their own resources). That being so, 
there is a wider public interest in 
regulatory reform. 

The thesis that the "business" of 
regulation is becoming too much for 
governments to handle has been put by 
Dr Peter Grabosky, an Australian 
commentator on regulatory policy. In his 
words, "governmcnts arc not 
omnicompetent". Nevertheless, 
governments of many countries have 
been torn between a pressure to reduce 
public spending, on the one hand, and an 
increasing pressure to deliver more, on 
the other He has suggested that, this 
being so, one way of addressing the issue 
is to harness resources outside the public 
sector. to mobilise non-governmental 
resources and to enter into "co- 
productive" arrangements with those to be 
regu~ated.~ 

Thus, governments may achieve more 
efficient and effective regulation, with 
better compliance, if they engineer a 
regulatory system in which they 

' themselves play a less dominant role, one 
in which they facilitate the "constructive 
regulatory participation of private 
 interest^",^ in which their role is in 
"man~pulat~ng rncentlves In order to 
facilitate the constructive contributions of 
non-government interestsn6 and in which 
they "act as facllitators and brokers, rather 
than ~ommanders".~ 

Negotiated rulemaking - "Reg-Neg" 

There is increasing international support 
for what Crabosky calls "interest co- 
option" - the concept of building support 
for policy outcomes, by involving those 
who are to be regulated in the actual 
process of making the regulations.' This is 
a recognition of the basic nostrum that all 
law is ~~ltimately dependent on consent for 
both legitimacy and enforceability. A good 
example is the concept of "negotiated 
rulemaking", also known as "Reg-Neg", 
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which operates under the (United States) 
Negotiated Rulemaking Act of 1990. 

Briefly, the basic idea behind Reg-Neg is 
that a government agency considering 
making a rule (which is the US equivalent 
of what most of us here would call a 
regulation) first brings together 
representatives of "affected partres" tor 
discussions on the proposal. The concept 
of "affected parties" incorporates interest 
groups, as well as those to be regulated 
by the proposed rule. When the parties 
are brought together, the object of the 
exercise is to achieve consensus about 
the text of the proposed rule, with a view 
to avoiding costly litigation further down 
the track. This must be done carefully, lest 
the result be a reduction in regulatory 
quality through deal-doing by interest 
yruups a1 the expense of objective policy 
formulation. 

While Reg-Neg may be a rclativcly new 
concept in common law jurisdictions, 
several European countries have long 
histories of involving business and 
academic elites and other groups in a 
highly institutionalised structure with a 
consensus approach to rule-making 
France has its:Council of State and the 
Economic and Social Council, the 
Netherlands its Socio-Economic Council 
and Labor Foundation, Greece has a 
Council of ~ t a t e . ~  

An OECD commentator, Rex Deighton- 
Smith, has observed, "By contrast, the 
English speaking countries have not only 
not had many of these structures but have 
tended to look upon regulation-making ,as 
an activity which was more or less 
exclusively the concern of government".1° 

"Reg-Neg" Australian-style 

A form of negotiated rule making has 
been operating in Victoria since 1985, 
under provlslons of what is now Lhe 
Subordinate Legislation Act 1994. The 
general scheme requires that government 
departments consider various matters 

(including the existence of alternative 
methods of achieving the desired ends) 
before introducing regulations. There is 
also a requirement that the making of the 
proposed regulations be publicised in 
advance and that interested parties be 
con~ulted.'~ Finally, in all substantial 
cases, a "Regulatory Impact Statement" 
(KlS) has to be prepared by the 
government department proposing the 
regulation, in which the costs and benefits 
of the regulation - both economic and 
social - have to be evaluated.I2 The 
availability of an RIS also has to be 
advertised, and comments sought from 
those affected by the pro osal, before the 
regulation can be made. 19 

A similar system operates in New South 
Wales, under provisions of the (NSW) 
Subordinate Legislation Act 1909. There is 
also a regulatory reform Bill before the 
Australian Federal ~arl iament. '~ The Bill 
would require all "legislative 
 instrument^"^^ "directly affecting business, 
or having a substantial indirect effect on 
businessni6 to be subject to consultation 
procedures similar to those of Victoria. 
Unfortunately, due to the failure of the 
gnvernment tn take acco~~nt nf the 
criticisms by the Senate Standing 
Committee on Regulations and 
Ordinances of other less desirable 
features," that Bill may be defeated in the 
Senate. 

Victoria's experience of negotiated rule 
making 

The process of publication and public 
consultation in Victoria is monitored by the 
Scrutiny of Acts and Regulations 
~ommittee," a Committee of the Victorian 
Parliament of which I was the foundation 
Chair. The Committee's role includes one 
of scrutinising regulations to ensure that 
the formal requirements of the 
Subordinate Legislation Act have been 
~or~~pl iec l  witl~. III Lur 11 Ltlis requires Ltle 
Committee to assess the adequacy of the 
Regulatory Impact Statements. 
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Subsection lO(1) of the Subordinate 
Legislation Act prescribes that an RIS 
must include: 

(a) a statement of the objectives of the 
proposed statutory rule; 

(b) a statement explaining the effect of 
the proposed statutory rule, including 
in the case of a proposed statutory 
rule which is to amend an existing 
statutory rule the effect on the 
operation of the existing statutory 
rule; 

(c) statement of other practicable means 
of achieving those objectives, 
including other regulatory as well as 
non-regulatory mechanisms; 

(d) an assessment of the costs and 
benefits of the proposed statutory rule 
and of any other practicable means of 
achieving the same objectives, 

(e) the reasons why the other means are 
not appropriate; 

(9 any other matters specified by the : 
guidclincs; 

(g) a draft copy of the proposed statutory 
rule. 

With respect to "other practicable 
alternatives", I should note that the Office 
of Regulation Reform (ORR) has 
published a useful guide to what is 
envisaged by the concept. They include: 

performance-based regulation; 

CO-regulation; 

extending the coverage of principal 
legislation; 

removing other legislative impediments; 

a increased enforcement; 

tradeable permits/licences; 

voluntary codeslself-regulation; 

negative licensing; 

public education programmes: 

information disclosure; 

economic incentives; 

risk-based insurance or guarantee 
funds; and 

rewarding good behaviour.lg 

I want to focus for a moment on the 
requirement in paragraph (d) that an RIS 
contaln a cost-benefit analysis of a 
proposed statutory rule and of its 
identified alternatives. The cost-benefit 
analysis can be qulte substantial and may 
be particularly difficult in cases where the 
benefits are social rather than economic. 

The requirement to produce a document 
which, as best as possible, accurately 
assesses .costs and benefits has been 
reinforced by the Supreme Court and, 
more particularly, by the Scrutiny of Acts 
and Rcgulations Cornmittcc (SARC). Over 
recent years the Committee1 has rejected 
Regulatory Impact Statements relating to 
pollution controls over ports20 and over 
pollution controls over prescribed 
premises.21 In both cases, the assumption 
of the agencies was that an assertion of 
benefit was sufficient. In the first case 
following consultation between the SARC 
and the relevant Ministers, the 
Regulations remained in place for an 
agreed period while a new RIS was 
prepared and a new process of 
consultation took place. In the second 
case, a new protocol for EPAIindustry 
consultation was the extremely desirable 
result of a successful intervention by the 
scrutiny committee. 

It is important to note that, in assessing 
whether the requirements of subsection 
lO(1) have been met, the Committee is 
assisted by the work of the Office of 
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Regulation ~e fo rm. '~  This office has a 
formal role in the process because nf the 
requirement in subsection lO(3) of the 
Subordinate Legislation Act that 
"independent advice" be available as to 
the adequacy of an RIS. It is also 
important to note that, despite operating 
within the Government umbrella, ORR 
really does provide independent advice, 
and does not merely rubber-stamp RlSs 
provided by Government departments and 
agen~ies.~ Though it is not prescribed as 
the only source of such advice, ORR is 
the principal source of that advice. 
However, as a result of the operation of 
competition policy (and perhaps through 
some dissatisfaction by rule-makers with 
the stringent demands ot UKK) its role IS 

open to competition. There remains a 
danger that rule-making departments 
could seek to buy corr~pliar~l advice. 

While it is difficult to give precise 
quantitative evidence on the operation of 
the RIS procedures, it is my firm view (as 
Chairman of the Scrutiny of Acts and 
Regulations Committee) that the RIS 
procedures work and that they help to 
make regulations in Victoria both more 
effective and more efficient. Those rough 
quantitative estimates available support 
my assertion. ORR estimates about 20% 
of reaulatorv proposals coming to their 
attention via RIS drafts are either modified 
substantially or withdrawn, resulting in 
cost savings running into tens of millions 
of dollars. The 20% figure would 
underestimate the effect, in that many 
poor proposals do not proceed beyond a 
rough draft. Similarly, a United States 
Environment Protection Authority analysis 
of their experience with cost benefit 
analysis estimaled that it had saved the 
economy $1000 for every $1 spent doing 
it. 

Alternative compliance mechanisms 

I now turn to the most recent regulatory 
reform proposal, namely, the concept of 
"Alternative Compliance Mechanisms" 
(ACM), which are embodied in the 

(Canadian) Regulatory Efficiency Bill 
(C-62) Under this 1994 Rill, Ministers 
would be able to approve alternative 
methods of complying with regulations 
pertaining to a particular business or 
industry. Before a draft "compliance order" 
is negotiated between the government 
agency and the relevant business or 
iddustry group, there must be consultation 
with affected parties. It is a key feature of 
an ACM that, while it does not meet the 
prescriptive requirements of the relevant 
regulations, it must nevertheless meet the 
regulatory objectives of the regulations. 
In that sense, it focuses on the ends, 
rather than the means. 

However, the Canadlan proposal IS stalled 
or dead. The Bill was the subject of a 
scathing report by the Standing Joint 
Cunrmittee f u ~  the Sc~utiny uf qeyulations 
(The Canadian Scrutiny ~ o m m i t t e e ) . ~ ~  

Whilc taking no issuc with thc goals of the 
Canadian Bill (ie to relieve the public, 
especially businesses, from the effects of 
unnecessarily burdensome or costly 
regulations, etc), the Canadian Scrutiny 
Committee stated that the Bill represented 
"a major departure from traditions of law 
and government" and, as a result, "ought 
to be very carefully examined and 
tested".25 The particular problems that the 
Canadian Scrutiny Committee identified 
were that it would give the Executive a 
discretion to grant dispensations from the 
operation of subordinate laws in favour of 
individuals (which, the Committee said, 
amounted to a partial abrogation of the Bill 
of Rights of 1689) and that it was 
inconsistent with other constitutional 
values (including the rule of law and the 
principle of government ac~ountabilit~).'~ I 
need not tell an audience such as this that 
these are very serious matters, even if 
overstated in the report. 

At its last "outing", the proposal was 
defeated in the governing Federal Liberal 
Party's caucus room. In 1996, 1 travelled 
to Ottawa to interview its authors (the 
Regulatory Affairs Division of the Treasury 
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Board of Canada), proponents, and 
opponents. Both before and after my visit, 
I used lnternet and email to research the 
proposal and maintain contacts with those 
authors, proponents and opponents. It 
appears to me that the main reason for its 
defeat was a political assessment that the 
proposal would be bad politics in that it 
would be seen as the Liberal Party 
pandering to its business constituency. A 
secondary reason for its caucus defeat 
was a percelved lack ot equlty, in that only 
large corporations could afford the 
resources to successfully apply for and 
maintain an ACM. 

Regulatory efficiency legislation - the 
Victorian proposal 

While ACMs may have died in Canada, 
there is some impetus in Australia to take 
up the idea. This is, in part, a reflection of 
the fact that, as part of its platform for the 
1996 election, the Victorian State 
Government pledged that it would: 

Introduce Regulatory Efliciency 
Legislation which allows business to 
propose alternative means of compliance 
with regulatory objectives. This will lower 
compliance costs across a range of 
regulations, by allowing business to tailor 
~ts  method of compliance to suit its 
specific business circumstances and will 
build on flexibilities which are already 
being implement'ed in relation to specific ' 
legislation. 

For example, a road haulage firm with an 
integrated anti-fatigue program might 
have this accredited as an alternative to 
compliance with detailed driving log 
requireinents, or a business might 
propose an inspection schedule for 
major machinery which suits its own 
rrlair~tenarice schedule rather than 
meeting periodic requ~rements set In 

27 
regulation. 

This commitment was, in turn, taken up by 
the Executive Council, which (on 28 June 
1996) referred the issue of Regulatory 
Efficiency Legislation to the Law Reform 
Committee of the Victorian Parliament for 
inquiry, consideration and report. 

A proposal prepared by the Office o f  
Regulation Reform to the Victorran 
Government was made available to the 
Law Reform Committee. The proposal is 
similar to that in the Canadian Bill. This 
raises my suspicion that OECD meetings - 
which Australian and Canadian regulatory 
reformers attend - and the use of the 
lnternet result in a process whereby a 
reform proposal stalled in one jurisdiction 
will spring up in another! 

However, this is not necessarily a bad 
thing. An OECD Committee, the Public 
Management Committee has a Regulatory 
Management and Reform Group. This 
Group endeavours to ensure that 
regulation and regulatory systems are 
increasingly internationalised, with best 
practices being identified and information 
shared throughout the member countrles. 
An important theme is that as economies 
globalise, so regulation must be 
harmonised if it is not to replace tariffs and 
quotas as the most significant barrier to 
trade. 

In any event, we parliamentarians have 
taken to the lnternet too and my 
Committee will use the lnternet and its 
world-wide-web to undertake our process 
of consultation. You can be assured that 
we will be asking you t o  turn your minds t o  
the acceptability of alternative compliance 
mechanisms. 

The ORR proposal seems to have taken 
into account the reasons for the defeat of 
the Canadian proposal There  is a 
requirement that the proposal does not 
involve any lowering of regulatory 
standards and an assurance that 
proponents of Alternative Compliance 
Mechanisms would, in all cases, be 
required to demonstrate that their 
proposals would meet the identified 
regulatory objectives and performance 
standards at least as effectively as the 
specific regulations that they seek to 
replace.28 In particular, an ACM would not 
be approved if it would compromise any 
safety, health or environmental objectives 



AlAL FORUM No 14 

of the relevant regulations. There is also a 
commitment that the principles of equality, 
fairness, competitive neutrality and 
government accountability will be 
respected and that government budgetary 
policy will not be compromised. 

The scheme outlined by the ORR would 
apply only to statutory rules (within the 
meaning of the Subordinate Legislation 
Act 1994) and only to those statutory rules 
that are specifically "scheduled" by statute 
as being appropriate for the application of 
ACMs. A statutory rule would only be 
proposed for scheduling where it imposed 
an appreciable economic burden on 
business or another sector of the 
community. Proposals for scheduling 
would be made by the Minister 
responsible for the relevant legislation and 
would only be carried through after 
consultation with those persons and 
groups most likely to be affected by the 
scheduling. 

The proposal includes a requirement that 
the relevant Minister must prescribe all the 
"relevant criteria" that would be taken into 
account in deciding whether or not to 
approve an AGM. Certain "mlnlmum 
criteria" are suggested, namely: 

consistency with the stated statutory 
objectives; 

clea~ specification of the part(s) of the 
statutory rule(s) for which the ACM is to 
substitute; 

m a clear explanation of the proposal, 
including a description of how the 
stated regulatory objectives will be 
achieved under the ACM and 
identification of businesses, activities or 
categories of persons to be subject to 
the ACM; 

adequate means of monitoring 
compliance with an ACM, including 
sufficient access to information 
necessary for monitoring performance. 

The proposal envisages that there will be 
a requirement that the Minister publish 
(including in a daily newspaper circulating 
generally throughout Victoria) details of 
the statutory rule that is proposed to be 
scheduled, the stated statutory objectives 
and all "relevant criteria". It also proposes 
that the "relevant criteria" should be open 
to review by the Scrutiny of Acts and 
Regulations Committee, which would 
determine whether the criteria were 
adequate and whether they were 
consistent with both the stated regulatory 
objectives of the relevant statutory rule 
and the purposes and principles of the 
proposed Bill. 

Approval of an ACM would not be possible 
unless the formal requirements discussed 
above have been satisfied. There would 
also be an obligation on the relevant 
department of agency to evaluate the 
ACM and recommend to the Minister 
whether or not it should be approved. 
Before making such a recommendation, 
the relevant department or agency would 
be required to consult with parties and 
groups affected directly and significantly 
by the proposed ACM (including other 
departments and agencies). 

If a Minister decided to approve an ACM, 
he or she would be able to do so for 
whatever period he or she thought 
appropriate in a given case. The Minister 
would be required to publish notice of his 
or her approving the ACM and also to 
table such a notice in the Parliament. 
Thcrc would bc an obligation on the 
relevant department or agency to make 
copies of the ACM available to the general 
public for inspection and purchase. There 
would also be, an obligation on the 
proponent to inform all parties directly 
affected by the ACM (including the 
employees of the proponent, if relevant) of 
the details of the ACM. 

Under the proposal as outlined to the Law 
Reform Committee, the ACM would 
operate to bind both the Government and 
the proponent to its terms. The legislation 
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would contain a statement to that effect. It 
is also proposed that there be a 
mechanism in the proposed legislation to 
ensure that a breach of the ACM will 
render the proponent liable to prosecution 
in the criminal courts for a breach of the 
relevant regulations (ie that the ACM 
operates as an alternative to) andtor to be 
subject to the forfeiture of security 
deposits andlor any other penalty 
prescribed in the relevant guarantee. 

Finally, it is proposed that there be a 
discretionary power on the part of 
departments to recover the costs incurred 
in providing sewices relating to the 
preparation, finalisation evaluation and 
approval of a proposed ACM. There would 
be fees for any administrative action taken 
after the approval of an ACM, for 
example, where higher administrative 
costs are incurred or where requests are 
made to amend, vary, extend or cancel 
the approved ACM. 

Critics of the proposal may consider that it 
is just a way of facilitating the watering- 
down of standards that currently operate 
to keep business in proper check. This will 
not be the case because any alternative 
will not be politically acceptable. If this 
proposal is to work, it must be on the 
baSlS that the proponents ot ACMs can 
demonstrate that they meet the identified 
objectives of the relevant regulations (eg 
to keep the level of impurities in air or 
water below a certain percentage). A 
similar process already operates in 
Vi~tuna, ill Ll~e rur r r~  of State environment 
protection policies (SEPPs) issued under 
the Environment Protection Act 1970. 
Under those SEPPs, "environmantdl 
quality indicators and objectives" are set 
and must be met by businesses and 
bodies that come within their jurisdi~tion.'~ 

Further, if the proposal is ultimately 
adopted in Victoria, it will only work if it is 
in a form that ensures maximum 
transparency and accessibility to the 
general public and, in turn, maximum 
accountability of the Government to the 

electorate. It must not simply be a means 
for the Government to ingratiate itself with 
big business or a political party's financial 
backers. 

The Canadian criticisms need to be 
examined closely. There must not involve 
any inappropriate delegation of legislative 
power to the Executive Government. 
Transparency and accountability must be 
guiding principles for any proposed 
legislation. It will be necessary for the 
Minister to be accountable to the 
Parliament and the general public for any 
exercise of that power. This would be 
achieved by ensuring that proposals - and 
the criteria by which they are to be judged 
- are published. 

In my opinion, ACMs will only he politically 
acceptable if they are subject to the same 
level of parliamentary scrutiny as the 
primary regulation. Thus, they must be 
subject to disallowance by either House o f  
Parliament, with appropriate examination 
by the Scrutiny of Acts and Regulations 
Committee. 

Alternative compliance mechanisms in 
action? 

It is possible to argue that the concept of 
alternative compliance mechanisms 
already operates to some extent. A 
system of "accredited licensees" already 
operates in Victoria, under amendments 
made in 1994 to the Environment 
Protection Act 1970 ( ~ i c ) . ~ '  Under this 
system, companies subject to 
environmental regulation can be freed 
from "the standard prescriptive approach 
lu wu~ks approval and licenslng" lf they 
can demonstrate a high level of 
environmental performance and an 
ongoing capacity to maintain and improve 
that performance.31 

Three "corncrstoncs" are required of 
companies participating in the accredited 
licensee process: an environmental 
management system, an environmental 
audit program and an environmental 
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improvement plan. A company must be 
able to convince the Environment 
Protection Authority (EPA) that it meets 
these cornerstones to a sufficient 
standard If the EPA is so convinced, it will 
issue a licence that grants the licensee "a 
high degree of operational freed~m".~' 

Once issued with a licence, an operator 
must lodge performance reports to 
demonstrate to the EPA that they are 
complying with its terms. Continuation of 
the licence is assessed on the basis of 
actual environmental performance and is 
judged against factors such as licence 
compliance, implementation of 
environment improvement plans and legal 
compliance by the 0perator.j" 

The transparency aspect is met by a 
requirement for community participation, 
consultation and access, particularly in 
relation to the environment improvement 
plan. Accountability is facilitated by virtue 
of the cornerstones of the licence being 
the subject of review at a predetermined 
frequency that must not exceed 5 years.34 

As at 3 February 1997, 5 accredited 
licences were operating in ~ l c t o r l a . ~ ~  
Anecdotal evidence is that the concept 
works to the satisfaction of all concerned. 
In this context, it is important to note that 
the Chairman of the EPA, Dr Brian 
Robinson, recently said that the -overall 
aim of the accrcditcd licence system is 
"environmental improvement through co- 
operation between industry, government 
and the community" [emphasis added].36 

At the Australian Federal level, the 
Natinnal Rnad Transpnrt Cammissinn 
(NRTC) is also pursuing the concept of 
alternative compliance mechanisms. It 
issued a discussion paper on alternative 
compliance in May 1 9 9 4 ~ ~  and an interim 
regulatory impact statement on alternative 
compliance options in April 1995.~' My 
inquiries indicate that the NRTC is slowly 
but actively pursuing this proposal.39 

The bottom line is that the concept of 
alternative compliance mechanisms can 
work because, in Victoria at least, it 
appears to work. 

Regulatory budgets 

,The general theme of my paper is that 
governments are aware of the current 
challenges of regulation and are open to 
the alternatives that are being proposed to 
the system that 'currently exists. 1 should 
add, however, that this does not mean 
that I necessarily endorse all the reform 
options that are currently the subject of 
discussion in Australia and overseas. 

One option that I have in mind is that of 
the "regulatory budget", a concept that 
has generated not only interest but draft 
legislation in the United States. Under this 
concept, government agencies would be 
required to estimate the economic cost of 
implementing their regulatory policies and 
then to weigh this cost against the benefit 
that those policies would produce. 

Under this Republican proposal, a 
regulatory budget would be tabled 
annually along with the tlscal budget. 
Hardly radical is an obligation on 
government that only those policies whose 
benefits outweighed the net costs would 
be implemented. However, under the 
Republican proposal, there would be a net 
sum of money available to regulators from 
which the cost of regulation would have to 
be met. The effect of this would be that, in 
order to find the money to pay for new 
regulations, regulators would have to 
repeal some old ones. 

There are fundamental problems with this 
proposal, the most obvious being that it is 
"perilously" difficult to measure the value 
of, for example, a clean beach or racial 
equa~ity.~' It is worrying that it is 
superficially attractive to economic 
commentators who believe that a 
regulatory budget would force Congress 
and administrators to take responsibility 
for the cost of new laws, by making "bad" 
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regulation as politically embarrassing as 
wasteful spending.41 

The regulatory budget proposal is 
probably a political stunt in the hurly-burly 
of US politics. With the increasing 
prevalence of cost benefit-analysis in the 
ease of each new and remade regulation, 
it is a proposal that has no merit in the 
context of our Commonwealth systems. 

Conclusion 

In 1995, Christopher Booker, an English 
author and journalist, asserted that the 
British government had: 

recently unleashed the greatest 
avalanche of regulations in peacetime 
history; and wherever we examine their 
working we see that they are using a 
sledgehammer to miss a nut.42 

We can laugh at this hyperbole but, it 
seems, this thinking has a high level of 
credibility amongst our,'^ business 
constituency and even among the general 
public. 

Parliamentarians are not oblivious to thk 
concern. The Fourth Report of the UK 
House of Commons Procedure 
Committee, tabled in June 1996, observed 
that "There is widespread concern at the 
growing volume and complexity of 
delegated legislation, and the obvious 
deficiencies ' in its consideration and 
scrutiny by ~a r l i amen t " .~~  

While this may' be true in the United 
Kingdom, in the Australian State 
jurisdictions of Victoria and New South 
Wales, the volume of regulation has been 
almost halved with the impact of sunset 
clauses and regulatory impact statements. 
We need to worWhard to ensure that the 
general public and business understands 
what we are doing. Like the National 
Performance Review, Parliamentary 
Scrutiny Committees are amongst the 
best kept secrets of our parliaments. 

We need to ensure that commentators 
and the press acknowledge that (in some 
jurisdictions at least) efforts are being 
made to address the kinds of criticisms 
that are generally (and easily) made. 
While there is ample evidence to support 
the general thrust of such arguments, 
criticisms about the volume of regulations, 
for example, fail to recognise that, in some 
jurisdictions at least, there is legislation in 
place to require that redundant regulations 
be repealed.44 It is equally the case that 
not enough credit is paid to the efforts of 
governments who do explore and 
implement innovative regulatory 
strategies. 

Government should ensure that the 
resourcefulness of the private sector is 
brought to bear on regulatory mechanisms 
- whether it be by consulting the private 
sector on the form and content of 
regulations or by inviting the.private sector 
to use its own expertise (and resources) 
to develop alternative compliance 
mechanisms. Even if there are very few 
Alternative Compliance Mechanisms 
produced because of We high cost of 
preparation, we will have opened a door to 
business and an avenue of counter-attack 
to criticism. We will be able to invite critics 
of regulation to propose alternative means 
better benefiting the community and 
themselves. While this will not silence the 
radicals, most* business leaders are 
moderate and socially-responsible and will 
see the sense in our work. 

However, public confidence in such a 
system will only be developed and 
maintained if there is a vigorous 
parliamentary scrutiny committee, with a 
good profile and the trust of the media 
commentators. Bipartisanship and 
confidence are the keys. Regulatory 
reform will proceed. It is your task, ladies 
and gentlemen, to ensure that democratic 
principles are not set aside in the 
headlong rush to greater efficiency! 
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