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be allowed to participate in the re­
investigation of complaints against po­
lice. He emphasises that the seconded 
officers are of an extremely high cali­
bre, effective, credible and vigorous in­
vestigators and of value due to their ex­
perience of the NSW police force. How­
ever civilian investigators, especially 
former police from interstate or over­
seas or people with specialized experi­
ence, would supplement such a system 
and enable enquiries to be conducted 
more expeditiously and economically.

In response to the Special Report 
on ‘The First Three Years of the NSW 
Police Complaints System’ released in 
August 1987, NSW Premier, Mr Bar­
rie Unsworth indicated that the Gov­
ernment was ‘giving active considera­
tion to allowing civilian investigations.’ 
(Press Release 14 August 1987) Shortly 
afterwards, Mr Masterman’s ‘mix’ of 
police and civilian investigators was ap­
proved by Cabinet in the face of strong 
criticism from police representatives. 
(Sun 3 September 1987, DT 20 August 
1987)

a successor? Commenting on 
the Ombudsman’s resignation, Mr 
Unsworth said that Mr Masterman had 
made significant improvements to the 
nature of Government and would be 
particularly remembered for his work 
in dealing with complaints against po­
lice. (CT 4 September 1987) The ques­
tion that John Slee, the SMH’s legal 
writer, asked is ‘do Mr Unsworth and 
his Government . . . have the courage 
to appoint as successor to Mr Master- 
man a person as committed to it as he 
has been?’ (SMH 14 July 1987)

* * *

sentencing
A well-written life is almost as rare as 
a well-spent one.

Thomas Carlyle, Essays

three discussion papers. The ALRC 
has released three Discussion Papers 
dealing with proposals for reform of 
the sentencing process. Discussion Pa­
per 29, Sentencing: Procedure, sug­
gests principles to guide the courts in 
the imposition of punishment in accor­
dance with specified goals. Discussion 
Paper 30, Sentencing: Penalties, pro­
poses a new penalty structure. Dis­
cussion Paper 31, Sentencing: Pris­
ons, looks at the need for a prison sys­
tem in the Australian Capital Territory 
and suggests guidelines for regulating 
prisons. When releasing the first of 
the documents, the Commissioner-in­
charge, George Zdenkowski, said

While the criminal justice system at­
tributed great importance to proce­
dures necessary for the determination 
of guilt or innocence, it neglected pro­
cedures for the determination of pun­
ishment. Australia’s system of pun­
ishment is arbitrary and operates hap­
hazardly and inconsistently. For ex­
ample, the courts should not be able 
to increase sentences just because they 
see the particular crime as prevalent in 
the community. To do so is unjust. 
Merely because a person is convicted 
for such an offence does not mean he or 
she should be punished for the crimes 
of others. There is an urgent need 
for Australia to develop its own mod­
ern punishment system reflecting Aus­
tralian values relevant to the 21st Cen­
tury.

sentencing procedures. DP 29 dis­
cusses sentencing goals, procedures and 
general principles to guide sentencing
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authorities. It points out that there is 
currently little guidance in Australian 
law on the goals of sentencing or on 
how they are to be achieved. It sug­
gests that the goals of punishment 
should be set out in legislation to gov­
ern the sentencing of federal and ACT 
offenders. Just deserts should be the 
primary goal. Rehabilitation, incapaci­
tation and individual deterrence should 
be given subsidiary weight. General de­
terrence should be eliminated as a sen­
tencing goal.

reliable information. DP 29 also 
points out that the information used 
in determining sentence and the way 
it is presented to the court are largely 
unregulated. It is suggested that suffi­
cient information be available to assess 
the nature of the criminal conduct, the 
characteristics of the offender and any 
other relevant matters. Where any am­
biguity or uncertainty exists concern­
ing the circumstances of the offence the 
court should invite the Crown to ad­
duce such further relevant and admis­
sible evidence as may be available and 
should invite the defence to do like­
wise. If necessary, the court may of its 
own motion compel the production of 
further written or oral evidence (other 
than by the defendant) to inform itself 
as to the facts of the offence. Such ev­
idence should be on oath and cross ex­
amination permitted. Standard proce­
dures for resolving conflicts as to facts 
about the offence are also suggested. 
The information must be proved to be 
reliable. It is proposed to require proof 
and the application of the rules of ev­
idence to all factual material relevant 
to sentence. Pre-sentence procedures 
designed to reduce the time taken in 
court by the requirement of proof are 
suggested.

aggravating and mitigating factors. 
The law does not presently place any

limit on the matters which may be 
taken into account in sentencing. The 
Commission has proposed a statutory 
list of aggravating and mitigating fac­
tors to which judicial officers may have 
regard in formulating sentence. A plea 
of guilty entered for reasons other than 
remorse should not be regarded as a 
factor in mitigation but should still at­
tract a discount in sentence. Certain 
aggravating factors currently in use, 
such as the prevalence of the offence, 
and prior record to the extent that it is 
relied upon to justify excessive punish­
ment, should be excluded. Providing 
information about other offenders and 
the impact of sentence on third par­
ties should no longer be mitigating fac­
tors. Sentencers may step outside the 
approved list where the facts of the case 
clearly give rise to an aggravating or 
mitigating factor not listed, provided 
that the proposed goals of sentencing 
are adhered to.

appeals. A time limit should be im­
posed for bringing appeals against sen­
tence and credit should always be given 
for any time served in custody pend­
ing the hearing of the appeal. Submis­
sions are sought as to whether appeals 
against sentence should be as of right 
or by leave and as to whether there 
should be a change in the avenue of ap­
peals against sentence in federal cases 
from the State and Territory Courts of 
Criminal Appeal to the Federal Court. 
If appeals are to the Federal Court 
should it be empowered to hear ap­
peals against sentence for a State of­
fence, where the offender is also appeal­
ing against a federal offence and should 
it be empowered to transfer any appeal 
in a federal case to a State Supreme 
Court if it considers this more appro­
priate?

further guidelines. Other sentenc­
ing principles to guide decision mak-
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ers are set out. Where possible the 
courts should seek to ensure that repa­
ration is made by the offender to the 
victim. In some circumstances vic­
tim impact statements may be ten­
dered by the prosecution. The penal 
value of an offence should be deter­
mined by its seriousness, with regard to 
the harm or risk which the conduct in­
volved and the offender’s degree of cul­
pability for the offence. Judicial discre­
tion should be structured by reference 
to the principles of consistency, pro­
portionality and parsimony. The max­
imum punishment prescribed for an of­
fence should not be imposed except in 
the most extreme case and no cruel 
or unusual punishments should be im­
posed. There should be no imprison­
ment solely for rehabilitation. No pun­
ishment should be increased by the rea­
son only that there has been an in­
crease in the penalty prescribed for the 
offence since the time it was commit­
ted. Sentencing courts should give rea­
sons for sentence which indicate the 
facts relied upon in reaching sentence.

sentencing commissions. Sentenc­
ing Commissions can play a valu­
able role in collecting and disseminat­
ing sentencing information, developing 
sentencing guidelines, educating judi­
cial officers and advising Parliament 
and the courts on sentencing issues. A 
Federal and an ACT Sentencing Com­
mission should be established to per­
form these tasks. If there is not the 
money available to establish two Sen­
tencing Commissions then it is sug­
gested that one Sentencing Commis­
sion might be established in Canberra.

sentencing: penalties. In a ratio­
nal system of punishment it is desirable 
that penalties prescribed by law corre­
spond to offence seriousness in a consis­
tent fashion and that different penalty 
types be applied in accordance with

readily accessible rules. Penalty struc­
tures in Australia are inconsistent and 
chaotic. Discussion Paper 30 proposes 
a new penalty structure which includes 
a hierarchy of sanctions and a hierar­
chy of offences. It is proposed that 
there be a list of authorised sentencing 
options, selected from available State 
and Territory options, for federal of­
fenders. Such a list would be an ex­
haustive one drawing only upon exist­
ing options considered acceptable by 
the Commission. These options should 
be legislated for and set out in a clearly 
defined hierarchy in ascending order of 
severity. The following list is offered for 
consideration: absolute discharge, con­
ditional discharge, fine, deferment of 
sentence, probation order, community 
service order, attendance centre order, 
periodic detention, imprisonment. Not 
all options will be available in all juris­
dictions so courts sentencing federal of­
fenders will need to inform themselves 
as to the availability of sentencing op­
tions. The penalty structure proposed 
should also apply in the ACT. This will 
involve expanding the range of sentenc­
ing options so that ACT courts will 
have the same hierarchy of sanctions 
available to them as courts sentencing 
federal offenders. Two extra sentencing 
options might also be added. Consid­
eration should be given to establishing 
a pilot scheme based on the European 
day fine system in the ACT and home 
detention as a sentencing option. The 
latter scheme should not involve elec­
tronic surveillance.

an offence hierarchy. The ALRC 
also proposes that a hierarchy of of­
fences be established which relates in 
a consistent way to the hierarchy of 
sanctions outlined above. The first 
step in this process involves dividing of­
fences into specified categories accord­
ing to seriousness. In ranking offence



[1987] Reform 178

seriousness the Commission was guided 
by the view that a greater premium 
should be placed on personal physical 
security than the security of property. 
Further, offences against the person 
should be ranked according to harm 
and culpability while offences against 
property should be ranked according 
to the method of commission. This 
ranking should take into account both 
public perception and sentencing prac­
tice. It is tentatively proposed that 
there be at least eight categories of of­
fences: Category A should be life im­
prisonment. It should be discretionary 
and only available for murder. Cate­
gory B should have a maximum period 
of imprisonment of 15 years and should 
only be available for offences regarded 
as extremely serious by the commu­
nity such as complicity in or conspir­
acy to murder, manslaughter and ex­
tremely serious forms of drug traffick­
ing. Category C should have a max­
imum of 10 years imprisonment. Of­
fences in this category might include 
armed robbery, hijacking aircraft, ag­
gravated sexual assault, assault in­
tentionally occasioning grievous bodily 
harm, kidnapping and other offences 
against the person involving acts en­
dangering life. Category D should carry 
a maximum of 5 years imprisonment 
and apply to break enter and steal, se­
rious fraud or misappropriation, arson 
and driving causing death. Category E 
should have a maximum penalty of 
2 years imprisonment. It might include 
theft, receiving, unlawful possession of 
stolen goods and reckless driving. Cat­
egory F should have a maximum of 
6 months imprisonment and should in­
clude gaming and betting, theft under 
$1 000, escape from custody and inde­
cent acts. Category G should not have 
imprisonment available as a penalty. It 
should cover all offences not specifically 
allocated to other categories. Cate­

gory //should be fixed monetary penal­
ties dealt with on an infringement no­
tice basis such as airport parking viola­
tions and minor tax and customs mat­
ters.

choice of sanction. Once an offence 
seriousness hierarchy has been deter­
mined and a classification of sanctions 
has been achieved, there still remains 
the question as to how these are to 
be related. What rules should gov­
ern the allocation of particular sanc­
tions in the hierarchy to particular of­
fence categories? The Commission sug­
gests that guidelines should be incorpo­
rated in the sentencing legislation pro­
viding that: offences in categories A, 
B and C should presumptively result 
in a custodial sentence; offences in cat­
egories D, E and F should presump­
tively result in a non-custodial sen­
tence; offences in categories G and H 
should only result in a non-custodial 
sentence. Once a particular type of 
disposition has been determined, the 
court should fix the penalty level by ref­
erence to the aggravating and mitigat­
ing factors. Mitigating factors should 
operate to reduce the penalty type or 
amount of penalty otherwise appropri­
ate. Aggravating factors should op­
erate to increase the penalty type or 
amount otherwise appropriate.

other suggestions for the imposi­
tion of punishment. Imprisonment 
should be a punishment of last resort. 
Additional guidelines should be intro­
duced in the proposed sentencing leg­
islation in this respect. There should 
be a general downgrading of maxi­
mum penalties and a particular down­
grading of maximum penalties in re­
spect of non-violent property related 
offences. Prison terms should be im­
posed in weeks to be served rather 
than by years or months. If a non­
custodial sentence is selected, the court
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should impose the least onerous form of 
non-custodial disposition warranted by 
the circumstances having regard to the 
severity scale referred to. The erod­
ing effect of inflation on fines should 
be addressed by introducing a penalty 
unit system whereby the prescription 
of a monetary maximum fine for each 
offence is replaced by a defined num­
ber of penalty units. When courts im­
pose a fine on federal or ACT offenders 
they should first conduct a means in­
quiry which takes account of the defen­
dant’s income, assets, debts and depen­
dants. The legislation governing such 
inquiries should reflect the approach in 
the Penalties and Sentences Act 1985 
(Vic). A defendant given a fine on con­
viction should be able to opt to perform 
community service in lieu of payment 
of the fine in whole or in part. Sus­
pended sentences should not be avail­
able for federal and ACT offenders. 
Existing provisions granting the courts 
power to suspend sentences should be 
repealed. Existing powers to impose 
so-called split sentences whereby the 
court partially suspends a sentence of 
imprisonment should also be removed. 
Courts sentencing ACT and federal of­
fenders should retain the power to de­
fer passing sentence for a limited pe­
riod. The maximum period of super­
vision during probation should be one 
year. Community service orders should 
only be made with the consent of the 
offender and a maximum number of 
hours which can be ordered (say 300) 
and a maximum number of hours which 
can be served each week (say 40) should 
be fixed. The Commission invites com­
ment on the desirability of introducing 
home detention as a sentencing option 
for federal offenders and on the restric­
tions which should apply. If it is in­
troduced it ought to be a genuine al­
ternative to imprisonment, not merely 
an additional sentencing option which

carries the risk of net-widening. There 
should be a general prohibition on com­
bining penalties. The broad excep­
tion to this is that it should be pos­
sible to combine fines and ancillary or­
ders with non custodial, non monetary 
penalties. Gender, per se, should not 
form the basis for differential treatment 
as far as sentencing is concerned. Com­
monwealth habitual offender legislation 
should be repealed.

conditional release. A sentence does 
not end when an offender is condition­
ally released from custody. Rather it 
continues to be served in the commu­
nity under appropriate supervision and 
conditions. There are various forms 
of conditional release. The Commis­
sion proposes that parole remain as a 
form of conditional release and that 
there be a separate system of parole 
for federal and ACT Offenders. Where 
such offenders are serving fixed terms 
they should be automatically released 
on appropriate conditions to be spec­
ified by the parole board after serv­
ing one third of their sentence. Life 
sentence prisoners would not be cov­
ered by this scheme however their suit­
ability for parole should be considered 
not longer than 10 years after the com­
mencement of sentence. If these sug­
gestions are implemented it will mean 
that there will no longer be any need 
for release on licence schemes for fed­
eral or ACT offenders.

special categories of offend­
ers. Should Aboriginally be included 
in a legislative statement of mitigating 
factors and ought there be special sen­
tencing options available for Aborigi­
nal offenders or special rules regulating 
the operation of sentencing options for 
Aboriginal offenders? A broader range 
of sentencing options for use against 
corporations is required. Should all or 
any of the following sentencing options
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be adopted for corporate offenders: dis­
solution, disqualification from govern­
ment contracts, equity fines, internal 
discipline orders, organisational reform 
orders, punitive injunctions, commu­
nity service orders and publicity or­
ders? Offenders found unfit to plead or 
not guilty by reason of insanity should 
no longer be detained at the Governor- 
General’s pleasure. Alternative dis­
positions are put forward based upon 
recent changes in other jurisdictions. 
Submissions are sought on the desir­
ability of hospital orders, treatment 
orders, guardianship orders and pro­
gram orders being available for ACT 
and federal mentally disordered offend­
ers found guilty or found not guilty by 
reason of insanity.

sentencing: prisons. It is pro­
posed that a prison system be estab­
lished in the ACT. The ACT has re­
lied on the already overcrowded New 
South Wales prisons for too long. This 
view is shared by ACT prisoners and 
their families and by almost all ACT 
judges, magistrates, police and welfare 
officials interviewed by the Commis­
sion. The ACT is a mature commu­
nity of over 250 000 people and should 
assume complete responsibility for its 
criminal justice system including the 
welfare of its prisoners. In developing 
a prison system, the ACT should de­
velop new standards for the humane 
containment of prisoners. It should 
take the opportunity to avoid the prob­
lems found in State prison schemes and 
should develop a system along the lines 
of the model outlined in the Discus­
sion Paper. The Commission has pro­
posed the establishment of an ACT 
prisons system to occur in two stages. 
The first stage would see the estab­
lishment of an open (minimum secu­
rity) prison, a new remand centre and 
possibly a periodic detention/work re­

lease centre. The second stage would 
be the construction of a closed (max­
imum/medium security) prison. All 
these facilities could be combined in 
one complex. The Commission has not 
recommended that a separate prison 
system for federal offenders be estab­
lished at this stage. The Commission 
has however made a number of specific 
proposals designed to protect the inter­
ests of both federal and ACT prison­
ers. The Convention against Torture 
and other Cruel Inhuman or Degrad­
ing Treatment or Punishment should 
be ratified to provide safeguards for all 
Australian prisoners as well as for all 
members of the community. Legisla­
tion should guarantee that no federal 
or ACT offenders are punished by cor­
poral punishment, solitary confinement 
or dietary restrictions. The Health In­
surance Act (Cth) should be amended 
to ensure that all prisoners are cov­
ered by Medicare, to the same extent 
as members of the community, for med­
ical costs incurred for treatment pro­
vided other than by prison medical of­
ficers. The Commonwealth Electoral 
Act 1918 should be amended so that 
persons with convictions are no longer 
prevented from voting in Federal elec­
tions. Federal legislation should be 
introduced to remove restrictions on 
the capacity of federal and ACT pris­
oners to sue in the courts because of 
their convictions. Sentencing authori­
ties should receive detailed information 
about prison conditions and programs 
(such as drug rehabilitation programs) 
available in prisons in their jurisdic­
tion. Federal funding should be pro­
vided to the States to enable compli­
ance by them with the Minimum Stan­
dard Guidelines for Australian Prisons. 
Any ACT Prisons Ordinance should 
provide prisoners with certain basic 
rights and should contain guiding prin­
ciples to structure future developments



[1987] Reform 181

and the exercise of discretion by prison 
staff. The discussion paper also con­
tains detailed proposals for the treat­
ment of ACT prisoners, an ACT prison 
discipline scheme and grievance mech­
anisms for ACT prisoners.

comment invited. All three Discus­
sion Papers and a summary of them are 
available from the Commission. The 
Commission’s proposals are tentative 
and are published in order to attract 
public comment. Extensive consulta­
tions including public hearings in all 
Australian capital cities will be un­
dertaken later this year. Submissions 
are invited and should be directed to: 
Mr George Zdenkowski, Commissioner- 
in-Charge, Sentencing Reference, Law 
Reform Commission, GPO Box 3708, 
Sydney NSW 2001, DX 1165 Sydney, 
Telephone (02) 231-1733, Fax (02) 223­
1203.

* * *

constitutional commission
There is only one thing in the world 
worse than being talked about, and 
that is not being talked about.

Oscar Wilde, The Picture 
of Dorian Gray.

reports of advisory committees. 
Discussion of the Australian Consti­
tution has increased markedly in re­
cent months. The Constitutional Com­
mission’s Advisory Committees on Ex­
ecutive Government, Distribution of 
Powers, Trade and National Economic 
Management and the Australian Ju­
dicial System have now reported to 
the Commission and their reports have 
been published. The report of the Ad­
visory Committee on Individual and 
Democratic Rights was discussed in the

previous issue of Reform ([1987] Re­
form 125).

The Constitution is also the sub­
ject of a most entertaining book by 
Associate Professor Michael Coper en­
titled Encounters with the Australian 
Constitution published by CCH Aus­
tralia Limited. Professor Coper is a 
member of the Advisory Committee on 
Trade and National Economic Manage­
ment to the Constitutional Commis­
sion. Various chapters in the book pro­
vide useful background information to 
the reports of the Advisory Commit­
tees. For example, chapter 4, ‘How Far 
Can the Commonwealth Go?’ provides 
a useful background to the report of the 
Advisory Committee on Distribution of 
Powers, chapters 5 and 7 entitled re­
spectively ‘The Fiery Fiscal Furnace’, 
and ‘Guaranteed Free Intercourse and 
Other Advantages of Border Crossing’ 
provide background to the report on 
Trade and National Economic Manage­
ment and chapter 6 ‘Apocalypse 1975’ 
to the report on Executive Govern­
ment. Students of the Constitution 
should also be fascinated by the second 
chapter which delineates the history of 
the federal movement and the drafting 
of the Constitution.

executive government. Four of the 
matters dealt with in the report of 
the Advisory Committee on Executive 
Government are:

• the head of state
• the system of government
• the power of the Senate to block 

supply
• the position of the Governor- 

General.

head of state. The Committee rec­
ommends that a referendum to make 
Australia a republic should not be held


