
1993-94-95 

THE PARLIAMENT OF THE COMMONWEALTH OF AUSTRALIA 

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Presented and read a first time 

(Employment, Education and Training) 

ABORIGINAL EDUCATION (SUPPLEMENTARY ASSISTANCE) 
AMENDMENT BILL 1995 

CONTENTS 
Section 

1. Short title 
2. Commencement 
3. Schedule 

SCHEDULE 

AMENDMENTS OF THE ABORIGINAL EDUCATION (SUPPLEMENTARY 
ASSISTANCE) ACT 1989 

9509420-1,065/21.6.1995-(94/95) Cat. No. 95 5057 7 ISBN 0644 440236 





1993-94-95 

THE PARLIAMENT OF THE COMMONWEALTH OF AUSTRALIA 

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Presented and read a first time 

(Employment, Education and Training) 

A BILL 
FOR 

An Act to amend the Aboriginal Education (Supplementary 
Assistance) Act 1989 

The Parliament of Australia enacts: 

Short title 
1. This Act may be cited as the Aboriginal Education (Supplementary 

Assistance) Amendment Act 1995. 

5 C:onnnnencennent 
2. This Act commences on the day on which it receives the Royal Assent. 

Schedule 
3. The Aboriginal Education (Supplementary Assistance) Act 1989 is 

amended in accordance with the items in the Schedule. 



2 Aboriginal Education (Supplementary 
Assistance) Amendment No. ,1995 

SCHEDULE 

AMENDMENTS OF THE ABORIGINAL EDUCATION 
(SUPPLEMENTARY ASSISTANCE) ACT 1989 

1. Subsection 13B(3): 
Omit "$84,131,000", substitute "$83,861,000". 

2. Subsection 13B(4): 
Omit" $256,000", substitute" $83,636,000". 

Section 3 

Printed by Authority by the Commonwealth Government Printer (94/95) 

9 780644 440233 


