1980-81-82
THE PARLIAMENT OF THE COMMONWEALTH OF AUSTRALIA

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Presented and read a first time, 22 April 1982

(Minister for Education)

A BILL

FOR

An Act to amend the States Grants (Schools Assistance) Act

1980

BE IT ENACTED by the Queen, and the Senate and the House of

Representatives of the Commonwealth of Australia, as follows:

Short title, &c.

1. (1) This Act may be cited as the States Grants (Schools Assistance)

5 Amendment Act 1982.

(2) The States Grants (Schools Assistance) Act 1980' is in this Act

referred to as the Principal Act.

Commencement

2. This Act shall come into operation on the day on which it receives the

10  Royal Assent.

Limit on grants under section 40

3. Section 41 of the Principal Act is amended by omitting “$1,123,000” and

substituting “$1,134,500”.

1,650/22.4.1982—(208/82) Cat. No. 82 4324 2—Recommended retail price 30c



2 States Grants (Schools Assistance) Amendment ~ No. , 1982

Limit on grants under section 41B

4. Section 41C of the Principal Act is amended by omitting “$2,246,000”
and substituting “$2,269,000”.
Substitution of Schedules

5. (1) Schedules 1 to 4 (inclusive) to the Principal Act are repealed and
the Schedules set out in Schedule 1 to this Act are substituted.

(2) Schedules 7 to 10 (inclusive) to the Principal Act are repealed and the
Schedules set out in Schedule 2 to this Act are substituted.

Payments made before Royal Assent

6. Payments (including advances) by way of financial assistance made to a
State or to the Northern Territory under the Principal Act shall be deemed to
have been made for purposes of the Principal Act as amended by this Act.

10



States Grants (Schools Assistance) Amendment  No. , 1982 3

SCHEDULE 1 Section 5 (1)
New Schedules 1 to 4 (inclusive) to be inserted in the States Grants (Schools
Assistance) Act 1980
SCHEDULE 1 Section 7
GOVERNMENT SCHOOLS—BUILDING AND EQUIPMENT PROJECTS AND RECURRENT

EXPENDITURE

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4

Building and
equipment Recurrent

Name of State projects  expenditure Totals

$ $ $

New South Wales e e e 34,328,000 94,594,500 128,922,500

Victoria . . . . . . . . . . . . . ... 31,771,000 66,062,000 97,833,000

Queensland e e e e e 17,062,500 37,558,000 54,620,500

South Australia . . . . . . . . . . . . .. 11,547,500 24,147,500 35,695,000

Western Australia . . . . . . . . . . . . . 10,424,000 22,259,500 32,683,500

Tasmania . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. 3,600,500 7,854,000 11,454,500

Northern Territory . . . . . . . . . . . . . 1,436,500 2,302,000 3,738,500

Totals . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 110170000 254,777,500 364,947,500

SCHEDULE 2 Sections 9 and 23

RECURRENT EXPENDITURE—MIGRANT EDUCATION

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4
Non-
Government  government
Name of State schools schools Totals
$ $ $
New South Wales e e e e e e e 10,851,500 4,534,500 15,386,000
Victoria . . . . . . . . . . . . . . ... 12,159,500 4,465,000 16,624,500
Queensland e e e e e e e e 1,642,000 727,500 2,369,500
South Australia . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 3,738,500 1,211,000 4,949,500
Western Australia e e e e e e e 1,885,500 1,650,000 3,535,500
Tasmania . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .. 491,500 25,000 516,500
Northern Territory . . . . . . . . . . . . . 139,000 .. 139,000

Totals . . . . . . . . . . ... .. 30,907,500 12,613,000 43,520,500




4 States Grants (Schools Assistance) Amendment

SCHEDULE 1—continued
SCHEDULE 3

No. 1982

Sections 11,26 and 36

DISADVANTAGED SCHOOLS AND DISADVANTAGED COUNTRY AREAS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4 Column 5
Disadvantaged
Disadvantaged non-

government  government Disadvantaged
Name of State schools schools country areas Totals
$ 3 $ $
New South Wales 8,246,000 1,308,500 1,802,500 11,357,000
Victoria . 8,264,500 1,529,500 1,022,500 10,816,500
Queensland 2,387,500 224,500 1,483,500 4,095,500
South Australia 2,280,000 286,000 486,000 3,052,000
Western Australia 1,447,000 179,500 1,032,000 2,658,500
Tasmania . 499,000 69,500 351,000 919,500
Northern Territory 235,000 21,500 137,000 393,500
Totals 23,359,000 3,619,000 6,314,500 33,292,500
SCHEDULE 4 Sections 13 and 28

SPECIAL SCHOOLS

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3 Column 4

Non-

Government  government

special special
Name of State schools schools Totals
$ $ $
New South Wales 5,816,000 1,252,000 7,068,000
Victoria 3,982,500 1,543,000 5,525,500
Queensland 2,092,500 923,500 3,016,000
South Australia 1,560,500 146,500 1,707,000
Western Australia 1,331,000 203,500 1,534,500
Tasmania .. 551,000 . 551,000
Northern Territory 132,000 132,000
Totals 15,465,500 4,068,500 19,534,000




States Grants (Schools Assistance) Amendment

SCHEDULE 2

No.

, 1982 5

Section 5 (2)

New Schedules 7 to 10 (inclusive) to be inserted in the States Grants (Schools

Assistance) Act 1980

SCHEDULE 7

MISCELLANEOUS GRANTS

Sections 20, 45,47 and 50

Column 1

Total of all additional
grants under sections
18 and 19 for non-
government schools
in need of short-term
emergency assistance

Column 2 Column 3

Total of all grants Total of all grants
under section 44 under section

for temporary transfer 46 for approved

of teachers, &c. education centres

Column 4

Total of all grants
under section

49 for approved
special projects

3 3 $ $
679,500 143,000 1,783,500 3,695,000
SCHEDULE 8 Sections 31 and 34
MULTICULTURAL EDUCATION

PART I AMOUNTS OF GRANTS TO STATES
Column 1 Column 2
Name of State Amounts
$
New South Wales 1,160,500
Victoria 944,500
Queensland 498,500
South Australia 323,500
Western Australia 295,000
Tasmania ‘. . . 105,500
Northern Territory 39,500
Total 3,367,000

PART Il GRANTS IN RELATION TO APPROVED MULTICULTURAL EDUCATION

PROJECTS
TOTAL OF GRANTS $299,500



6 States Grants (Schools Assistance) Amendment  No. , 1982

SCHEDULE 2—continued
SCHEDULE 9 Section 38

RESIDENTIAL INSTITUTIONS

Column 1 Column 2
Name of State Amounts
$

NewSouthWales . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 0. 592,500
Victoria . . . . . . . o e e e e e 478,000
Queensland . . . . . . . . Lo, L L 0L 0L 250,000
South Australia e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e 156,000
Western Australia e e e e s e e 144,500
Tasmania e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e 52,000
Northern Territory . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . 15,000
Total e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e 1,688,000
SCHEDULE 10 Section 43

SERVICE ANDDEVELOPMENT ACTIVITIES

Column 1 Column 2
Name of State Amounts
$

NewSouthWales . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . .00 4,933,000
Victoria . . . . . . . L Lo o e e e e e e e e 3,942,500
Queensland . . . . . . . . L L L L Lo o e e e e e 2,121,500
South Australia e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e 1,263,000
Western Australia e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e 1,207,000
Tasmania e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e e 416,500
Northern Territory . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . . e 151,000
Total e e e e e e e e e e e e e 14,034,500

NOTE

1. No. 135, 1980, as amended. For previous amendments, see Nos. 52, 61 and 162, 1981.

Printed by Authority by the Commonwealth Government Printer









