
ARTHUR ROBINS ON & HEDDERWICKS 
1993 UBRJ:,HY 

THE PARLIAMENT OF THE COMMONWEALTH OF AUSTRALIA 

HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Presented and read a first time 

(Employment, Education and Training) 

A BILL 
FOR 

An Act to amend certain laws relating to vocational 
education and training 

The Parliament of Australia enacts: 

PART I-PRELIMINARY 

Short title 
1. This Act may be cited as the Vocational Education and Training 

5 Funding Laws Amendment Act 1993. 

Commencement 
2.(1) This Act, except for section 4 and Schedule 2, commences on the 

day on which it receives the Royal Assent. 

9314021}-1,325/27.9.1993-(140/93) Cat. No. 9342195 MRM 



2 Vocational Education and Training Funding Laws 
Amendment No. ,1993 

(2) Subject to subsection (3), section 4 and Schedule 2 commence on the 
day on which Part 3 of the Vocational Education and Training Funding Act 
1992 commences or on the day on which this Act receives the Royal Assent, 
whichever is the later. 

(3) If the commencement referred to in subsection (2) is not before 1 5 
January 1994, section 4 and Schedule 2 are repealed on that day. 

PART 2-AMENDMENTS 

Amendment of the States Grants (TAFE Assistance) Act 1989 
3. The States Grants (TAPE Assistance) Act 1989 is amended as set out 

in Schedule 1. 10 

Amendment of the Vocational Education and Training Funding 
Act 1992 

4. The Vocational Education and Training Funding Act 1992 is amended 
as set out in Schedule 2. 



Vocational Education and Training Funding Laws 
Amendment No. ,1993 

3 

SCHEDULE 1 Section 3 

AMENDMENT OF THE STATES GRANTS (TAPE ASSISTANCE) 
ACT 1989 

Paragraph 10(3)(e): 
Omit "$423,289,000", substitute "$420,582,000". 

Paragraph 10(3)(1): 
Omit "$502,319,000", substitute "$501,363,000". 

Paragraph 13(3)(d): 
Omit" $207,506,000", substitute" $218,378,000". 

Paragraph 13(3)(e): 
Omit" $207,506,000" , substitute" $218,378,000" . 

Paragraph 13(3)(1): 
Omit "$207,506,000", substitute "$218,378,000". 

SCHEDULE 2 Section 4 

AMENDMENT OF THE VOCATIONAL EDUCATION AND 
TRAINING FUNDING ACT 1992 

Paragraph 9(I)(a): 
Omit "$630,795,000", substitute "$638,960,000". 

Paragraph 9(1)(b): 
Omit "$709,825,000", substitute "$719,741,000". 

Printed by Authority by the Commonwealth Government Printer (140/93) 



9 780644 269100 


