
160 No. 50. Wheat Industry Stabilization (Refund of C/w,rge). 1950 

D1lpooalof 5. The Board shall apply all moneys received by it in pursuance moneJII by \11. 
Bo"rd. of this Act as if they wne the proceeds of the sale by the Board of 

Short iltJe. 

Commene~ment. 

Amendmen\ of 
certain Acts. 

wheat harvested in the year which commenced on the first day of 
October, One thousand nine hundred and forty-seven, and acquired 
by the Commonwealth under the National Security (Wheat Acquisition) 
Regulations. 

SALARIES (STATUTORY OFFIOES) 
ADJUSTMENT. 

No. 51 of 1950. 

An Act to increase the Salaries payable to the 
Holders of certain Statutory Offices. 

[Assented to 14th December, 1950.] 

BE it enacted by the King's Most Excellent Majesty, the Senate, 
and the House of Representatives of the Commonwealth of 

Australia, for the purpose of appropriating the grant originated in the 
House of Representatives, as follows ;-

1. This Act may be cited as the Salaries (Statutory Offices) Adjust­
ment Act 1950. 

2. This Act shall be deemed to have come into operation on the 
first day of July, One thousand nine hundred and fifty. 

3. The Acts specified in the first column of the First Schedule to 
this Act (being Acts fixing the salaries payable to the holders of the 
offices respectively specified in the second column of that Schedule) 
are amended as respectively specified in the third column '0£ that 
Schedule. 



No. 51. Salaries (Statutory Offices) Adjustment. 1950. 

~. Each Act specified in the first column of the Second Schedule 
to this Act, as amended by this Act, may be cited in the manner 
specified in the second column of that Schedule opposite to the reference 
to that Act in the first column. 

See. 3. 

First Column. 

Act. amended. 

J viliciary Act 1903-1948 

Oommonwea1tk Ooncilia· 
tion and Arbitration 
Act 1904-1949 

Bankruptcy Act 1924-
1948 

Seat of Government 
Supreme Oourt Act 
1933-1947 

THE SCHEDULES. 

FIRST SCHEDULE. 

Second Column. 

Offices. 

Chief Justice of the 
High Court 

Jlistice of the High 
Court 

Chief Conciliation 
Commissioner and 
Conciliation Com. 
missioner 

Chief Judge of the Com· 
monwealth Court 
of Conciliation and 
Arbitration 

Judge of the Common. 
wealth Court of 
Conciliation and 
Arbitration 

Judge of the Federal 
Court of Bankruptcy 

Judge of the Supreme 
Court of the Aus· 
tralian Capital 
Territory 

Third Column. 

Amendments. 

Section 47-
Omit from sub·seotion (1.) 

"Four thousand five hun· 
dred pounds", insert " Five 
thousand pounds" 

Seotion 47-
Omit from sub·section (1.) 

"Four thousand pounds", 
insert "Four thousand five 
hundred pounds " 

Section 10-
Omit sub·section (1.), insert 

the following su b·sections :-
"(1.) The salary of the 

Chief Conciliation Commis· 
sioner shall be at the rate of 
Two thousand two hun· 
dred and fifty pounds a year 
and the salary of each other 
Conciliation Commissioner 
shall be at the rate of One 
thousand eight hundred 
pounds a year. 

"(lA.) The Consolidated 
Revenue Fund is, to the 
necessary extent, hereby 
appropriated accordingly." 

Section 21-
Omit from sub·section (1.) 

"Four thousand pounds". 
ins!'rt "Four thousand five 
hundred pounds" 

Seotion 21-
Omit from sub·section (1.) 

"Three thousand five hun· 
dred pounds", insert" Four 
thousand pounds " 

Seotion 18BB-
Omit from sub· section (1.) 

"Three thousand five hun· 
dred pounds", insert" Four 
thousand pounds" 

Seotion 8B-
Omit from sub· section (1.) 

"Three thousand pounds ", 
insert" Three thousand five 
hundred. pounds" 

161 



162 1950. Salaries (Statutory Offices) Adjustment. No. 61. 

FIRS'!' SOHEDUJ.E--continued. 

First Column. Second Column. Third Column. 

Amendments. Act. amended. Offices. 

Arbitration (Public Ser· Public Service Arbitra· Section 7-
mce) Act 1920--1947 tor 

Audit Act 1901-1948 

Commonwealth PubUc 
Service Act 1922--1948 

Auditor-General .. I 

Chairman of the PubUc 
Service Board 

Member of the Public 
Service Board 

Commonwealth RailwaY8 Commonwealth Rail-
Act 1917-1936 ways Commissioner 

Land Tax A 88/l8ament Act Commissioner of Land' 
1910--1949 Tax 

Omit from sub-section (1.) 
" Two thousand seven hun­
dred and fifty pounds", 
insert" Three thou~and two 
hundred and fifty pounds" 

Section 4-
Omit "Two thousand seven 

hundred and fifty pounds", 
insert" Three thousand two 
hundred and fifty pounds" 

Section 13-
Omit from sub-section (1.) 

"Three thousand five hun­
dred pounds", insert" Four 
thousand pounds" 

Section 13-
Omit "Two thousand seven 

hundred and fifty pounds ", 
insert " Three thousand two 
hundred and fifty pounds " 

Section 14-
Omit from sub-Recti on (I,) 

.. Three thousand pounds", 
insert "Three thousand five 
hundred pounds» 

Section 5-
Omit from sub·section (5.) 

" Three thousand pounds ", 
insert" Three thousand five 
hundred pounds " 

Assistant Commissioner 
of Land Tax 

Section 5-
Omit from sub-section (5.) 

.. Two thousand two hundred 
and fifty pounds", inserl 
.. Two thousand seven hun­
dred and fifty pounds" 

3ec.4. SECOND SCHEDULE. 

,... JI~ "i'_'~ ~ FIrst Cohlmn. 

~ Acts amended. 

Judiciary Act 1903-1948 
Commonwealth Conciliation and Arbitration 

Act 1904-1949 
Bankr11ptcy Act 1924-1948 
Beal of GovernmeTlll Supreme Court Act 

1933-1947 
Arbitration (Public S~nnce) Act 1920-1947 
Audit Act 1901-1948 
Commonwealth Public Ser:vice Act 1922- , 

I!l4S 
Commonwealth RailwC&y8 Act 1917-J036 
Land Tax AS8e8sment Act .1910--1949 

Second Column. 

Citations. 

J udiriary A -t H103-1950 
Commonwealth Conciliation and Arbitraticm 

Act 1904-1950 
Bankruptcy Act 1924-1950 
Seat of GO?lernment Supreme Court Act 

1933-191)0 
Arbitration (Public Service) Act 1920--1950 
Audit Act 1901-1950 
c.ommonwealth Public Sertoice Act 1922~ 

1950 
Commonwealth RailwaY8 Act 1917-l9~0 
Land Tax As .. essment Act 1910-1950 


