
NORTHERN TERRITORY OF AUSTRALIA 

Regulations 1981, No. 27* 

Regulations under the Motor Vehicles Act 

I, ERIC EUGENE JOHNSTON, the Administrator of the Northern 
Territory of Australia, acting with the advice of the Executive 
Council, hereby make the following Regulations under the Motor 
Vehicles Act. 

Da.ted this 11th day of September, 1981. 

E.E. JOHNSTON 
Administrator 

AMENDMENTS OF THE MOTOR VEHICLES (REGISTRATION 
LABELS AND MISCELLANEOUS) REGULATIONS 

1. COMMENCEMENT 

These Regulations shall come into operation on a date to be fixed 
by the Administrator by notice in the Gazette. 

2. PRINCIPAL REGULATIONS 

The Motor Vehicles (Registration Labels and Miscellaneous) Regu
lations are in these Regulations referred to as the Principal 
R~lations. 

3. DEFINITIONS 

Regulation 5 of the Principal Regulations is amended by omitting 
the definition of "registration label". 

4. ISSUE AND TYPE OF LABELS 

Regulation 6 of the Principal Regulations is amended by inserting 
", type" after "colour". 

* Notified in the Northern Territory Government Gazette on 25 
Sept~ber, 1981. 

A. •• CUl,UDILL, G vemment Printer 01 the N rthern Terrlt ry 

I'riI;e:SO """" 



Motor Vehicles (Registration Labels and 
Miscellaneous) 

5. AFFIXING OF REGISTRATION LABELS 

Regulation 7 of the Principal Regulations is amended -

(a) by omitting from sub-regulation (1) "20 feet" and substituting 
"6 metres"; 

Cb) by omitting from sub-regulation (2)(a)(0 "windscreen;" and 
substituting "windscreen; or"; 

(c) by omitting from sub-regulation (2)(a)(ii) "windscreen." and 
substituting "windscreen; and"; and 

Cd) by omitting sub-regulation (2)(b), (c) and (d) and sub
stituting the following: 

"(b) in the case of a motor vehicle other than a motor 
vehicle to which paragraph (a) applies - the label shall 
be securely affixed to -

6. REPEAL 

(0 the rear number plate of the motor vehicle, in such 
a manner that the characters on that number plate 
are not obscured; or 

(ii) a place on the motor vehicle, 

as directed by the Registrar.". 

Regulations 8 and 9 of the Principal Regulations are repealed. 

7 . LABEL DESTROYED, DAMAGED, &c. 

Regulation 11 of the Principal Regulations is amended -

(a) by omitting "or the period for which a trader's plate is 
issued"; and 

Cb) by omitting "3 dollars" and substituting "$3". 

8. LABEL TO BE DESTROYED ON EXPIRY 

Regulation 12 of the Principal Regulations is amended -

(a) by omitting "or the period for which a trader's plate was 
issued"; and 

Cb) by omitting "or to whom the trader's plate was issued". 

2 



Motor Vehicles (Registration Labels and 
Miscellaneous) 

9. DESTRUCTION OF LABEL WHEN REGISTRATION IS CANCELLED, 
&c. 

Regulation 13 of the Principal Regulations is amended by omitting 
sub-regulation (2). 

10. OFFENCES IN RELATION TO REGISTRATION LABELS 

Regulation 14(1)(a) of the Principal Regulations is amended by 
omitting "to which a trader's plate is affixed or". 

11. OFFENCES 

Regulation 19 of the Principal Regulations is amended by omitting 
"20 dollars" and substituting "$100". 

3 



I! 


