
REGUL_ATIONS 1974. No. 18* 

Regulations under the Public Service Ordinance 

I JOHN NOR:\IAN NELSON, .the Administrator of the Northern 
, Territory of Australia. having received the ad\'ice of the 

Administrator's Couneil. and, in rebtion to officers of the Departmen: of 
the Legislative Council. on the recommendation of the President of lhe 
Council, h'~reby mak:.? tb:: following R.:glllations und.:r the Public Service 
Ordinance in rclarion t,) all olii.cers. 

Dated this nineteenth day of August, 1974. 

J. NELSON 
Administrator 

AMENDMENTS OF THE r"\.JRU(; SERVIC'!2 REGULATIONS 

1. Regulation 4 of thc Public Service Regulations is repeakd. 

2. Regulation 16 of the Publk Service RegulCltions is repealed and the 
following regulation substitut.:d: 

"16. An officer shall not llse for a purpose, other than for the discharge 
of his official duties, information gained by, or conveyed to, him through 
his conncxion with the Service:'. 

Repeal or 
regulation 4 

Use CIf 
Service 
information 

3. Regulation 31 of the Public Service Regulations :s amended by Salaries 

omitting sub-regulations (1), (l A), (1 B) and (1 c) and substituting the 
following sub-regulation,: 

"( 1) For the purposes of section 9 of the Ordinance, an officer of the 
Department of the Administrator shall, subject to this regulation. be paid 
a salary in dollars at the annual rate specified in Table A or Table B in 
-this sub-regulation, being the rate, or rate within lhe limits of the scale of 
rates, of salary that is appli.:able to his otlke having r~gard to its classi­
fication. 

TABLE A 
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ 

2113 2535 2713 2958 3165 3422 3662 3845 
4114 4225 4343 4373 4461 4521 4566 4579 
~638 4735 4762 4770 4771 4901 4950 4951 
5033 5129 5133 5144 5165 5224 5380 5450 
5534 5563 5594 5676 5806 6014 6022 6219 
6237 6249 6420 6~51 6484 6666 6677 6912 
7160 7405 7421 7454 7647 7652 7899 7953 
8145 8147 8392 8526 8639 8886 9218 9548 
9876 10207 10538 11032 11525 12019 12510 13004 

13498 13991 14484 
-~----~ .. -,-~-~~-----.--------~~---. - - -----------
'Notified in the Northern Territory Government Gazette on 22 August, 1974. 

45 



46 Public Service Regulatiolls 

TABLE B 
$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ 

2063 2220 2476 2664 2845 2888 3108 3319 
3342 3596 3755 3840 4040 4126 4223 4314 
4320 4417 4440 4514 4~60 4611 4680 4708 
4741 4801 4805 4902 4920 4960 5048 5131 
5179 5195 5342 5345 5398 5429 5489 5553 
5579 5618 5636 5729 5764 5783 5836 5880 
5930 5989 6052 6098 6127 6195 6264 6272 
6323 6492 6500 6504 6520 6590 6678 6710 
6717 6744 6914 6929 6967 7111 7180 7205 
7433 7683 7758 7935 8167 8187 8392 8438 
8460 8607 8690 8942 9108 9194 9338 9532 
9869 9870 10204 10541 10879 11383 11886 12389 

12890 13394 13898 14401 14904 

"(lA) For the purposes of section 9 of the Ordinance-
(a) an officer of the Department of the Legislative Council shall, 

subject to this regulation, be paid a salary in dollars at the 
annual rate specified in the Table in this paragraph, being 
the rate, or rate within the limits of the scale of ratcs, of 
salary that is applicable to his office having regard to its 
classification. 

and 
TABLE 

$ $ $ $ $ $ $ $ 
4393 4488 4583 4678 4822 4966 5110 5254 
5409 5806 6022 6237 6451 6666 6912 7160 
7405 7652 8886 9218 9548 9876 10207 10538 

12019 12510 14484 

(b) notwithstanding the classification of such an office. the rate or 
scale of rates so specified shall be 'increased, with effect from 
and including 30 May 1974, on account of variations in the 
cost -of livin~ by an annual amount equal to the sum of-
(i) 2 per cent of the rate or scale of rates so specified; 

and 
(ii) $130. 

"(1B) A Typist, Grade 1 shall be paid an allowance-
(a) at the rate of $152 per annum if he is not entitled -to an allow­

ance under paragraph Cb) and he has passed a test con­
ducted by or on behalf of the Administrator ,in typing at the 
raJte of 50 words per minute and in typing letters and other 
documents with due regard to punctuation and form; or 

(b) at the rate per annum in dollars specified in the second column 
of the table in this paragraph in relation to the highest speed 
in words per minute specified in the first column of that 
table at which he has passed a test conducted by or on behalf 
of the Administrator in writing shorthand, being a test also 
is correctly transcribing that shorthand. 

TABLE 

Shorthand speed in Rate per 
words a minute annum 

1$ 
80 155 

100 310 
120 465 

-----



Public Service Regulations 

"(le) A Steno-Secretary, Grade 2 who--

(a) has passed a test conducted by or on behalf of the Administrator 
in writing shorthand at a speed of 140 words a minute and 
in correctly transcribing that shorthand; and 

(b) is required to take and transcribe notes of evidence in courts, 
or is employed on duties of a like nature, 

shall be paid an allowance at the rate per annum that is equal to the dif­
ference between the rate at which salary is payable to her and $7511 per 
annum", 

4. Regulation 42( 1) of the Public Service Regulations is amended by 
omitting "$1.80" and substituting "S2", 

5. (l) Regulation 52 (1 ) (a) of the Public Service Regulations is amended 
by omitting "$19.65" and substituting "$22.50". 

(2) Regulation 52 (1 ) (b) of the Public Service Regulations is amended 
by omitting "$14.75" and substituting "$ 17". 

(3) The rates of travelling allowance provided by regulation 52 of the 
Public Service Regulations as amended by sub-regulations (1) :md (2) 
apply in relation to the service of an officer or tl'mporary employee on and 
after 30 May 1974. 

Meal 
allowance 

Travelling 
allowance 

47 




