REGULATIONS 1976. No. 32°

Regulations under the Public Service Ordinance

I, JOHN ARMSTRONG ENGLAND, the Administrator of the Northern Territory
of Australia, having received the advice of the Administrator’s Council and, in
relation to officers of the Department of the Legislative Assembly, on the recom-
mendation of the Speaker of the Assembly, hereby make the following Regulations
under the Public Service Ordinance in relation to all officers.

Dated this eleventh day of December, 1976.

J. A. ENGLAND
Administrator

AMENDMENTS TO THE PUBLIC SERVICE REGULATIONS

1.(1) Regulation 31 of the Public Service Regulations is amended by inserting
after sub-regulation (1ap) the following sub-regulation:

“(1aE) Notwithstanding the classification of such an office, the rate or scale of
rates specified in Table B in sub-regulation (1) that is applicable to an office shall
be further increased with effect from and including 25 November 1976, on account
of variations in the cost of living, by an amount equal to 2.2% of that rate or scale
of rates as increased up to but not including 25 November.”.

(2) Regulation 31 (1a) (a) of the Public Service Regulations is amended by
omitting “$178” and substituting “$181”,

(3) Regulation 31 (1a) (b) of the Public Service Regulations is amended by
omitting the second column of the table in that paragraph and substituting the
following column:

“Rate per annum
181

361
5427

(4) Regulation 31 (1B) of the Public Service Regulations is amended by omit-
ting “$178” and substituting “$181”,

2. Regulation 51 (1) of the Public Service Regulations is amended by omitting
“$15,939” and substituting “$16,290”.

* Notified in the Northern Territory Government Gazette on 17 December, 1976,

235

Salaries

Certain
officers not
entitled to
overtime






