240

Short title
and com-

mencement.

Repeal.

Short title,

Interpre-
tation.

No. 54. Public Officers Protection (Repeal). 1965,
PUBLIC OFFICERS PROTECTION (REPEAL).

No. 54 of 1965.

AN ACT to repeal the Public Officers Protection
Act 1934 and the Public Officers Protection
Act 1963. [22 December 1965.]

BE it enacted by His Excellency the Governor of Tasmania,

by and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and House of Assembly, in Parliament assembled,
as follows:—

1—(1) This Act may be cited as the Public Officers Protec-
tion (Repeal) Act 1965.

(2) This Act shall commence on the day on which the
Limitation of Actions Act 1965 commences.

2 The Public Officers Protection Act 1934 and the Public
Officers Protection Act 1963 are repealed.

DECIMAL CURRENCY.

No. 55 of 1965.

AN ACT to revise the law of the State in conse-
quence of the adoption of decimal currency in

Australia and to make provision for matters inci-
dental thereto. [22 December 1965.]

BE it enacted by His Excellency the Governor of Tasmania,

by and with the advice and consent of the Legislative
Council and House of Assembly, in Parliament assembled,
as follows:—

1 This Act may be cited as the Decimal Currency Act 1965.

2— (1) In this Act, unless the contrary intention appears—

‘“ appointed day” means the fourteenth day of
February 1966;



1965. Decimal Currency. No. 55. 241

“ Commonwealth Act” means the Currency Act 1965
of the Commenwealth, and includes that Act as
amended from time to time and any Common-
wealth Act passed in substitution therefor;

“industrial award ” means any determination, award,
order, regulation, by-law, or other instrument
made or issued under an Act and having the effect
of fixing, determining, or prescribing the amounts
or rates of remuneration to be paid to employees
or any class of employees (including employees
of the Crown) in any trade, business, profession,
calling, undertaking, or institution;

“new currency ”’ means the currency provided for by
the Commonwealth Act;

“old currency ” means the currency provided for by
the Coitnage Act 1909-1947 of the Commonwealth;

“ provision ”, used in relation to an Act or statutory
instrument, means any Part, Division, subdivision,
section, subsection, regulation, sub-regulation, by-
law, rule, sub-rule, paragraph, sub-paragraph,
clause, sub-clause, schedule, appendix, form, or
other portion of the Act or instrument, but does
not include any portion of an Act or statutory
instrument in which there is contained or set forth
a copy of an agreement or arrangement or pro-
posed agreement or arrangement or any heads of
agreement to be embodied in a proposed agree-
ment or arrangement;

“ statutory instrument” includes—

(e¢) an instrument that is a statutory rule within
the meaning of the Rules Publication Act
1953;

{(b) an instrument having effect by virtue of
any regulation, by-law, rule, proclama-
tion, order-in-council, order, or other
instrument made, issued, or granted under
the authority of an Act; and

(¢) any other instrument (whether of a legis-
lative character or not) that is made,
issued, or granted under the authority
of an Act, or in the exercise of the prero-
gative rights of the Crown, whether by
the Governor or by any other person.

(2) Nothing in this Act applies to or in relation to the
construction of, or affects the operation of—

(a) an industrial award;

(b) a judgment or order given or made by any court,
judge, police magistrate, or justice in eriminal
or civil proceedings; or

(¢) an award made on a submission to arbitration
under the Arbitration Act 1892.



242

Amendments
of Acts.

Amendments
of the
Co-operative
Houging
Societies

Act 1963.

References to
old currency
to be

construed as
references to

new currency.

No. 55. Decimal Currency. 1965.

3— (1) The provisions that are specified in the second
column of the first schedule opposite to the titles of the Acts
that are specified in the first column of that schedule are
amended as respectively specified in the third column of
that schedule.

(2) The Crown Lands Act 1935 is amended as specified in
the second schedule.

(3) This section shall commence on the appointed day.

4 The Co-operative Housing Societies Act 1963 is amended
as specified in the third schedule.

85—(1) Subject to this section, a reference in a provision
of an Act or statutory instrument (being an Act or instru-
ment passed, made, issued, or granted before the appointed
day) to an amount of money in the old currency shall be
construed on and after that day as a reference to a correspond-
ing amount of money in the new currency, calculated on the
basis of the equivalents referred to in subsection (4) of
section eight of the Commonwealth Act.

(2) Where such a reference as is mentioned in subsection
(1) of this section is to a percentage, rate, or proportion
expressed in terms of money, the reference shall be construed
as a reference to an equivalent percentage, rate, or proportion
expressed in terms of money in the new currency.

(8) Where such a reference as is mentioned in subsection
(1) of this section occurs (whether in tabular form, columnar
form, or otherwise) under or in relation to—

(e) all or any of the words “ pounds”, * shillings”,
and “ pence ”’ or other words of like import, that
reference shall, on and after the appointed
day, be construed as a reference to the word
“dollars” or, as the case may require, to the
words “dollars” and “cents” in combination
with the appropriate number (if any) of
dollars or of dollars and cents; or

(b) all or any of the symbols “£”, “s”, and “d” or
other symbols of like import, that reference
shall, on and after the appointed day, be con-
strued as a reference to a symbol recognized as
denoting the dollar, in combination with the
appropriate number (if any) of dollars or, as
the case may require, of dollars and cents.

(4) Where in any provision of an Aect or of a statutory
instrument (being an Act or instrument passed, made, issued,
or granted before the appointed day) it is provided that an
amount shall be calculated to the nearest pound, or to the
nearest shilling, or to the nearest sixpence, or to the nearest
penny, that provigion shall, on and after that day, be construed
as providing that that amount shall be calculated—

(e¢) to the nearest dollar, in the case of a reference
to the nearest pound;



1965. Decimal Currency. No. 55.

(b) to the amount of ten cents or the nearest multiple
of ten cents, in the case of a reference to the
nearest shilling;

(¢) to the amount of five cents, in the case of a refer-
ence to the nearest sixpence; and

(d) to the nearest cent, in the case of a reference to
the nearest penny.

(5) For the purposes of this section, a guinea is the sum
of one pound and one shilling in denominations of money in
the old currency.

(6) Every—
(a) Act; and
(b) instrument,

the construction of which is affected by any of the foregoing
provisions of this section is, by forece of this subsection,
amended to such extent as may be necessary to give effect
to those provisions.

(7) This section does not—

(a) affect the operation of any specific amendment of
a provision that is made by section three and
the first schedule or the second schedule, or
section four and the third schedule, or under
the authority of section eleven or section twelve;
nr

(h) apply to or in relation to any Act that is specified
in Part I of the fourth schedule or any provision
that is specified in Part II of that schedule.

6 Where an Act or statutory instrument passed, made,
issued, or granted before the appointed day prescribes or
contains a form that refers to an amount of money in the old
currency or provides for an amount of money to be specified
in that currency, a person using the form may fill it in in
such a manner as to set forth the equivalent of that amount
in the new currency.

7— (1) Where, on or after the appointed day, an instru-
ment that is subject to duty under the Stamp Duties Act
1931 is stamped for the purposes of that Act that instrument
shall be deemed to be properly stamped for the purposes of
that Act if, before the day on which this subsection ceases
to have effect, there is impressed on or affixed to the instru-
ment the proper stamp or stamps denoting the amount of
money in terms of the old currency that, if impressed on
or affixed to the instrument immediately before the appointed
day, would have made the instrument a properly or duly
stamped instrument for the purposes of that Act.

(2) Subsection (1) of this section shall cease to have
effect on a day to be fixed by proclamation.

243

Special
provisions
relating to

the payment
of stamp duty.



244

References in
registers, &ec.

Construction
of certain
references

to the com-
mencement of
the Currency
Act 1963 of
the Com-
monwealth,

Power to
appoint
special bank
holidays.

No. 55. Decimal Currency. 1965.

(3) Subject to subsection (1) of this seetion, for the
purpose of assessing the duty payable under the Stamp Duties
Act 1931 on an instrument executed or made on or after the
appointed day for or in respect of, or by reference to, a
consideration in money or money’s worth, or a payment,
expressed in terms of the old currency, that instrument shall
be treated as if the consideration or payment were expressed
as the corresponding amount in the new currency, calculated
on the basis of the equivalents specified in subsection (4) of
section eight of the Commonwealth Act, and the scale and
rates of duty prescribed, in terms of the new currency, in the
Stamp Duties Act 1931 apply to and in relation to such an
instrument accordingly.

8— (1) Where in a document (not being a statutory instru-
ment) that is made under the authority or for the purposes
of an Act or statutory instrument there appears a reference
to an amount of money (including a reference to a percentage,
rate, or proportion) expressed in terms of the old currency,
the provisions of section five, with the necessary adaptations
and modifications, apply to and in relation to that document
in the same manner as they apply to the provisions of Acts
and statutory instruments.

(2) The person who has the custody of a document to
which subsection (1) of this section relates may, where he
considers it necessary or desirable so to do for the purposes of
the administration of an Act or statutory instrument, alter
the document by substituting for such a reference therein
as is mentioned in that subsection the appropriate reference
in terms of the new currency.

(3) A reference to an amount of money expressed in terms
of the old currency in a document made or lodged under
the authority or for the purposes of the Companies Act 1962
or any corresponding previous enactment (being a document
that is kept by the Registrar of Companies) shall, on and
after the appointed day, be deemed to be a reference to the
equivalent amount of money expressed in terms of the new
currency, and the Registrar may accordingly alter or cause
to be altered any copy of that document that is kept or
issued by him.

(4) In this section, *document” includes a register,
record, or instrument.

9 Where in any Act or statutory instrument passed, made,
issued, or granted before the appointed day there is a refer-
ence to the date of the commencement of Part II of the
Currency Act 1963 of the Commonwealth, that reference shall
be construed as a reference to the appointed day.

10— (1) For the purpose of enabling savings banks carry-
ing on business in this State to facilitate the transition of the
banking business of those banks from the system of the old



1965. Decimal Currency. No. 55.

currency to the system of the new currency, the Governor
may, in accordance with the provisions of the Bank Holidays
Act 1919, appoint any day or days (being a day or days earlier
than the fourteenth day of February 1966) to be a bank
holiday or, as the case may be, to be bank holidays.

(2) A day that is appointed as a bank holiday pursuant
to this section shall not be deemed fo be a holiday, or a
bank holiday, or a public holiday for the purposes of any
gldu%rzigl award or for the purposes of the Public Service

ct .

11— (1) Notwithstanding any other law or rule of law to
the contrary, if—

(a) a doubt or difficulty arises in relation to the
construction under this Act of a reference in
any other Act to an amount of money, or to a
percentage, rate, or proportion expressed in
terms of money; or

(b) in the opinion of the Governor, this Act omits
to make adequate provision for the amendment
of a provision of any other Act resulting from
the adoption of the new currency,

the Governor may, by order, make such provision as he
considers just and reasonable for the purpose of resolving
that doubt or difficulty or rectifying that omission.

(2) Without prejudice to the generality of the provisions
of subsection (1) of this section, an order under this section
may—

(a) be made for or with respect to resolving doubts
or difficulties arising, or that, in the opinion
of the Governor, may arise, in respect of the
correspondence (calculated on the basis of the
equivalents specified in subsection (4) of section
eight of the Commonwealth Act) of amounts of
money (including percentages, rates, or propor-
tions affecting money) when expressed in the
old currency and in the new currency;

(b) be made for or with respect to correcting any
errors or anomalies that, in the opinion of the
Governor, have arisen in the substitution by
this Act in terms of the new currency of refer-
ences to amounts of money (including references
to percentages, rates, or proportions affecting
money) in terms of the old currency; and

{¢) amend the first schedule, the second schedule, or
the fourth schedule by amending any item
occurring therein, adding any item thereto, omit-
ting any item therefrom, or substifuting a new
item for any item occurring therein.

245

Power of
Governor to
resolve
doubts, &e.



246

Power of
Governor to
amend
statutory
instruments.

No. 55. Decimal Currency. 1965.

(3) An amendment effected by an order made under this
section may be expressed to commence on such date (whether
before or after the date of the making of the order but not
earlier than the appointed day) as may be specified in that
behalf in the order, and if no date is so specified in an order,
the order shall commence, or shall be deemed to have com-
menced, on the appointed day.

(4) An order made under this section has effect according
to its tenor on and from the date on which it commences
or is deemed to have commenced as if it were expressly
enacted in this Act.

(5) The power conferred on the Governor by this section
shall not be exercised after the expiration of a period of
six months after the appointed day.

12— (1) Notwithstanding any other law or rule of law to
the contrary, the Governor may, by order, amend any statutory
‘iinstrument made, issued, or granted before the appointed

ay—

(a) by substituting references to amounts of money in
terms of the new currency for references therein
to amounts of money in terms of the old cur-
rency ; and

(b) by making provision for any matter that is ancil-
lary to or consequent upon the making of such a
substitution.

(2) An amendment effected by an order made under this
section may be expressed to commence on such date (whether
before or after the date of the making of the order but not
earlier than the appointed day) as may be specified in that
behalf in the order, and if no date is so specified in an order,
the order shall commence, or shall be deemed to have com-
menced, on the appointed day.

(8) An order made under this section—
(a) may be made without regard to—

(i) any method or procedure required by law
for the amendment of the statutory
instruments, or of any class or kind
of the statutory instruments, to which
it relates; or

(ii) the fact that any statutory instrument,
or kind or class of statutory instru-
ments, to which it relates is or may
be incapable of amendment apart from
this section; and

(b) has effect according to its tenor on and from the
date on which it commences or is deemed to have
commenced and is not subject to appeal, dis-
allowance, or any similar procedure.




1965. Decimal Currency. No. 55.
THE FIRST SCHEDULE.
(Section 3 (1).)
AMENDMENT OF ACTS.
SECOND
First COLUMN. CoLUMN. THIRD COLUMN.
Short title of Act. :E;?;z(sii:d? How amended.
Administration and | Section 44| From subsection (3) omit “four
Probate Act 1935 pounds per centum?” and substitute
“four per cent”.
Section 64| Omit “five pounds per centum” and
substitute “ five per cent”.
i Omit “ eight pounds per centum ” and
: substitute * eight per cent?”.
|

Advances to British : Section 5 From subsection (1) omit “five

Settlers Aect 1928 pounds ten shillings for every one hun-
dred pounds thereof” and substitute
“five and one-half per cent”.
Aid to Mining Aect | Section 3 From subsection (4) omit * pound”
1927 (wherever occurring) and substitute
“dollar ” (in each case).
Section 5 From subsection (1) omit “pound”
(wherever occurring) and substitute
“dollar ” (in each case).
Ambulance Act 1959 | Section 27! From subsection (5) omit “one half-
penny for each pound” and substitute
“.2083 cents for each dollar ”.

Boundary Fences {Section 12! Omit “six pounds per centum” and
Act 1908 substitute ‘“six per cent”.

Section 18| Omit “six pounds per centum” and
substitute “six per cent?”.

Burnie Marine Section 5 From subsection (1) omit “three
Board Loan Act pounds fifteen shillings per centum”
1985 and substitute “ three and three-quarter

per cent”.
The second] From paragraph 4 of the form of
schedule | debenture omit “ three pounds fifteen
shillings per centum”™ and substitute
“ three and three-quarter per cent?”,

Burnie Marine Section 5 From subsection (2) omit *four
Board Loan Act pounds ten shillings per centum?” and
1936 substitute “ four and one-half per cent ”.

Section 7 From paragraph («¢) of subsection (6)
omit “four pounds fifteen shillings”
t?.nd substitute “four and three-quar-
er ”,

Cash Orders Act Section 12| Omit “ ninepence for each one pound ”
1947 and substitute “ three and three-quarter

per cent”. ) i
- T e

Casual Workers Section 11| From subsection (1) omit * four
and Unemployed pounds per centum” and substitute
Persons Homes “four per cent?”,

Act 1936

247



248

No. 55.

Decimal Currency.

1965.

FirsT COLUMN.

Short title of Act.

SECOND
CoLUMN.
Provision
amended.

THIRD COLUMN.

How amended.

Cecilia Button

Memorial Hospital

Agreement Act
1946

Charitable
Institutions
Act 1888

Christ College Act
1926

Cireular Head
Marine Board
Loan Act 1950

Civil Process Act
1870

Closer Settlement
Act 19567

Clyde Water Act
1898

Companies Act 1962

Deceased Persons’
Estates Duties
Act 1931

Section 5

The second
schedule

Section 15

Section 16

Section 7

Section 6

Section 19

Section 12

The second
schedule

Section 8

Omit “threepence in the pound ¥ and
substitute ‘“one and one-quarter per
cent .

From the third item omit “four-
pence for every seventy-two” and sub-
stitute “ one cent for every twenty ”.

From the first paragraph omit “ One
thousand Pounds in the first year, Nine
hundred Pounds in the second year,
Eight hundred Pounds in the third year,
and Seven hundred Pounds every suc-
ceeding year, then such sums?” and
substitute “the sum of one thousand
four hundred dollars that sum”.

Omit “ Four pounds per centum ” and
substitute “four per cent?”.

(2) omit ¢ four
and substitute

From subsection
pounds per centum?”
“ four per cent”.

Omit “twelvepence of and for every
twenty shillings” and substitute “five
cents of and for every dollar”.

Omit “one hundred pounds” (wher-
ever occurring) and substitute *two
hundred dollars” (in each case).

Omit “sixpence of and for every
twenty shillings” and substitute * five
cents of and for every two dollars”,

Omit “twenty-five pounds” and sub-
stitute ¢ fifty dollars”.

Omit “sixpence for every mile” and
substitute ¢ five cents for every mile ”.

Omit “twelvepence for every twenty
shillings ” and substitute ‘five cents
for every dollar ”.

Omit “ sixpence only for every twenty
shillings ” and substitute “five cents
only for every two dollars”.

From subsection (1) omit “ penny”
and substitute *cent”.

Omit “ Three Pence in the Pound
upon” and substitute “one and one-
quarter per cent of 7,

Omit “ Sixpence in the Pound ” and
substitute “ two and one-half per cent”.

From item 3 omit “£5 per £1000 or
any fractional part of £1000 for any
increase up to £5000” and substitute
“$10 per $2000 or any fractional part
of $2000 for any increase up to
$10,000 .

From subsection (1) omit “ ten pounds
per centum” and substitute “ten per
cent 7,



1965. Decimal Currency. No. 55.
SECOND
FIRST COLUMN. COLUMN. THIRD COLUMN.
Short title of Act. Provision How amended.

Section 9 From subsection (5A) omit “ pounds ”.

Section 10| From subsection (3) omit “ ten pounds
per centum ” and substitute *ten per
cent 7.

Section 13| From subsection (1) omit “ ten pounds
per centum ” and substitute “ten per
cent .

Section 26| From subsection (3) omit “ ten pounds
per centum ” and substitute “ten per
cent ",

Devonport Marine | Section 7 From subsection (2) omit “four
Board Loan Act pounds per centum” and substitute
1946 “four per cent”.

Devonport Marine |Section 7 From subsection (2) omit * four
Board Loan Act pounds per centum” and substitute
1953 “four per cent”.

Drainage Act 1934 |Section 25| From subsection (1) omit “ ninepence
in the pound ” and substitute “ three and
three-quarter cents in the dollar”.

Education Act 1932 | Section 80| From subsection (5) omit “ two pounds
ten shillings per centum ” and substitute
“two and one-half per cent”.

Section 31| From subsection (1) omit “five
pounds ten shillings per eentum” and
substitute “ five and one-half per cent ”.

From subsection (2) omit “ one pound
per centum ” and substitute * one per
cent 7.

Farmers’ Debt Section 88| From paragraph (b) of subsection (5)
Adjustment omit “four pounds per centum” and
Act 1936 substitute “ four per cent .

From sub-paragraph (i) of paragraph
(¢) of subsection (5) omit “four
pounds per centum ” and substitute
“four per cent”.

Flinders Marine Section 6 From subsection (2) omit “ pounds”.
Board Loan Act
1952

Florentine Valley |Section 11| From subsection (1)—

Paper Industry
Act 1935

Omit “ten pounds per centum?”
(twice occurring) and substitute * ten
per cent” (in each case).

Omit “ threepence” and substitute
“two and a half cents”.

Omit “ one pound or fraction of one
pound per centum?” and substitute
“one per cent or fraction of one per
cent ”’,

From subsection (2)—

Omit “eight pounds per centum”
and substitute “eight per cent”.

Omit “ ten pounds per centum ” and
substitute “ten per cent”.

From paragraph 111 of subsection (3)
omit “five pounds per centum” and
substitute “five per cent”.

249



No. 55. Decimal Currency. 1965.
SBCOND
FirsT COLUMN. COLUMN. THIRD COLUMN.
Short title of Act. Provision How amended.

Section 22 From subsection (6) omit “seven
pounds per centum” and substitute
““seven per cent”,

Florentine Valley Section 4 Omit “four pounds per centum?”
Paper Industry (wherever occurring) and substitute
Act 1937 “four per cent” (in each case).

Omit “ Five pounds per centum ” and
substitute “ five per cent”.

Fruit Board Act Section 7 From paragraph (c) omit “twenty
1934 shillings in the pound” and substitute

“one hundred cents in the dollar ”.

Gormanston Section 20{ ‘Omit “ One hundred Pounds sterling ”
Municipal and substitute “two hundred dollars”.
Lighting and Section 87| Omit “ Two shillings in the pound”
Power Act 1917 and substitute “ ten cents in the dollar ™.

Government Section 12| From subsection (4) omit “five
Printing Office shillings ” and substitute * one-quarter
Act 1949 of one”.

Grain Reserve Act | Section 15| From subsection (4) omit “five
1950 shillings ” and substitute “ one-quarter

of one”.

Hazil Insurance Act | Section 4 From paragraph (a) of subsection (1)
1957 omit “twopence” and substitute “ one

and two-third cents”.

Hobart Corporation [Section 114| From subsection (2) omit “ pounds”.
Act 1963 Section 116/ From subsection (2) omit * pounds”.

Section 127| From subsection (1) omit “ pound ”.

Section 131] From subsection (2) omit “ one shil-
ling in the pound ” and substitute “ five
cents in the dollar ”.

Section 179 From subsection (1) omit “ one shil-
ling in the pound ” and substitute “ five
cents in the dollar ”.

The third From form 15—

schedule Omit “£” (wherever occurring,
except where occurring before the
words “per cent”) and substitute
“$” (in each case).
Omit “£” (wherever occurring be-
fore “ per cent”).
Hobart Marine The title Omit “not exceeding £1,500,000 ”.
Board Loan Act .
1947 Section 6 From subsection (2) omit “four
pounds per centum?” and substitute

“four per cent”.
Homes Act 1935 Section 10| From subsection (9) omit “four

Hospitals Act 1918

Section 234

pounds per centum” and substitute

“four per cent”.

From subsection (1) omit “two
guineas ” and substitute “ four dollars
twenty cents”,



1965. Decimal Currency. No. 55.
SECOND
FIrsT COLUMN. CoLUMN, THIRD COLUMN.

Short title of Act.

Provision
amended.

How amended.

Hydro-Electric
Commission Act
1944

Lakes Sorell and
Crescent Conser-
vation Act
1901

Land and Income
Taxation Act
1910

Launceston
Corporation Act
1963

Section 26

Section 34A

Section 9

Section 184

Section 67

Section 89

Section 99

Section 101

Section 108

Section 109

Section 121
Section 176

Section 91

Section 131
Section 135

Section 140

From subsection (4) omit “five
shllings” and substitute ‘ one-quar-
ter of one”.

From subsection (1) omit “five
shillings ” and substitute * one-quar-
ter of one”.

From subsections (1) and (2) omit
“ Five Pounds per centum” (wherever
occurring) and substitute “five per
cent” (in each case).

From subsection (1) omit *“ one penny
for every pound ” and substitute “ four-
tenths of a cent for every dollar”,

From paragraphs (d) and (¢) omit
“pound ” (wherever oceurring) and
substitute ‘ dollar ” (in each case).

From subsection (1) omit “twenty
pounds per centum” and substitute
“twenty per cent ”.

From subsection (1) omit *“seven
pounds ten shillings in every one hun-
dred pounds” and substitute * seven
dollars fifty cents in every one hundred
dollars ”.

From subsection (2) omit “twelve
pounds ten shillings per centum” and
substitute “twelve and one-half per
cent .

From paragraph (b) of subsection (1)
omit “five pounds per centum?” and
substitute “five per cent”.

From paragraph (¢) of that subsec-
tion omit “twenty-five pounds per
centum ” and substitute * twenty-five
per cent”, .

From subsection (5)—

Omit “two pounds ten shillings per
centum ” and substitute “ two and one-
half per cent”.

Omit “ twenty pounds per centum ”
and substitute “twenty per cent”.
From subsection (1) omit “ pound”

and substitute “dollar ”. :

Omit “ten pounds per centum?® and
substitute “ten per cent”.

From paragraph (a) omit “five shil-
lings and sixpence” and substitute
“twenty-seven and a half cents?”.

From paragraph (b) omit “one shil-
ling and sixpence” and substitute
“seven and a half cents”.

From paragraph (¢) omit “one shil-
ling and threepence” and substitute
“six and a quarter cents?”.

From subsection (2) omit “ pounds”.

From subsection (1)—

Omit “ pound ”.
Omit “ pounds ”.
From paragraph (b) omit “ pound”.

251



252 No. 55.

Decimal Currency.

1965.

FIrsT COLUMN.
Short title of Act.

SECOND
COLUMN.
Provision
amended.

THIRD COLUMN.

How amended.

D g

Launceston Gas
Company’s Act
1858

Launceston Marine
Board Loan Act
1951

Lending of Money
Act 1916

Libraries Act 1943

Lilydale
Municipality
Lighting Act
1930

Loan (Provision of
Cool Stores) Act
1941

Local Authorities
Public Works
Subsidies Act
1936

Local Courts Act
1896

Local Government
Act 1962

Section 159
Section 164

Section 39
Section 40

Section 6

Section 4

Section 19

Section 3

The title

Section 13

Section 83A

Section 147

The fifth
schedule

The sixth
schedule

Section 213

From subsection (3) omit “ pounds ”.
From paragraph (¢) of subsection (9)
omit “ pounds”.

Omit “ Pounds ”.
Omit “ Pounds ”.

From subsection (2) omit “ pounds”.

From sub-paragraph (i) of paragraph
(a) omit * pounds” (first occurring).

From sub-paragraph (ii) of paragraph
(a) omit ‘“pounds ten shillings” and
substitute “and one-half ”,

From sub-paragraph (iii) of para-
graph (a) omit “ pounds” (first occur-
ring).

From sub-paragraph (iv) of para-
graph (a) omit “ pounds ten shillings”
and substitute “ and one-half .

From sub-paragraph (v) of paragraph
(a) omit “ pounds” (first occurring).

From subsection (10) omit “one-half
of one penny in the pound ” and substi-
tute ‘one-quarter of a cent in the
dollar 7.

From the first paragraph omit “ Two
Shillings in the pound ” and substitute
“ten cents in the dollar”.

Omit “ sum not ewceeding Ten thous-
and Pounds” and substitute “ certain
sum of money .

Omit “one shilling in the pound ” and
substitute “ five cents in the dollar ™.

Omit “ pounds”.

Omit “ forty shillings” and substitute
“ four dollars ”.

From rule 18 omit “ forty shillings
and substitute “four dollars ™.

From form 2 omit “ forty shillings”
and substitute “four dollars”.

From form 8 omit “forty shillings
and substitute “ four dollars .

From subsection (2) omit * four-
pence ” and substitute “ three cents”.

k24

”



1965. Decimal Currency. No. 55. 253

SECOND
FIrST COLUMN. COLUMN. THIRD COLUMN.
Short title of Act. Eyl;lo:gfi?$ How amended.

Section 232] From sub-paragraph (ii) of para-
graph (a) of subsection (2) omit
“ pound ” and substitute “ dollar ”.

Section 236/ From sub-paragraph (ii) of para-
graph (a) of subsection (1) omit
“pound” and substitute “ dollar ”.

Section 237) From paragraph (b) of subsection (1)
omit “ pound ” and substitute “ dollar ”.

Section 253| From paragraph (b) of subsection (1)
omit “ pound ” and substitute “ dollar”.

Section 254| From paragraph (a) of subsection (3)
omit “ pound ” and substitute * dollar ”.
Section 269] From subsection (1) omit “ sixpence
in the pound ” and substitute “ two and
a half cents in the dollar ”.
Section 262/ From subsection (2) omit “ pound”
and substitute “dollar”,
Section 265/ From paragraph (¢) of subsection (1)
omit “pound ” and substitute “ dollar ”.
From subsection (2) omit * pound”
and substitute ¢ dollar”.
Section 272 From subsection (1) omit * pounds ”.
From paragraphs (a¢) and (b) of
subsection (2) omit ‘“ pounds” (wher-
ever occurring).
Section 289 From subsection (2) omit “ pounds .
Section 321 From subsection (2) omit “one shil-
ling and sixpence in the pound” and
substitute “ seven and a half cents in
the dollar ”.
Section 861 From paragraph (¢) of subsection (6)
omit “ pounds ”.
Section 595{ From paragraph (a) omit “ pounds ”.
Section 596 From subsection (1) omit * pound ”.
Section 742) From subsection (2) omit “ one half-
penny in the pound?” and substitute
“one-quarter of a cent in the dollar ”.
Section 771 From paragraphs (b) and (e) of
subsection (6) omit “ pounds” (wher-
ever occurring).
Section 852| From subsection (1) omit “ one-tenth
of a penny in the pound ” and substitute
“one twenty-fourth of a cent in the

dollar 7.
The second| From form 6—
schedule— Omit the symbols “ £ s, N
Part IIT (wherever occurring) and substitute

the symbol “$” (in each case).

Omit the figures “6 2 6” and sub-
stitute the figures “12.25”.

Omit the figures “0 15 6” and
substitute the figures “1.55”.

Omit the figures “0 10 0 (wher-
ever occurring) and substitute the
figures “1.00” (in each case).

Omit the figures “7 7 6”7 and
substitute the figures “14.80 ”.

Omit the figures “4 19 0” and
substitute the figures “ 9.90 ”.

Omit the figures “0 14 9” and
substitute the figures ¢ 1.487”.




No. 55. Decimal Currency. 1965.
SECOND
FIRST COLUMN. CoLUMN. THIRD COLUMN.
Short title of Act. f;:;:z‘:&f How amended.

Omit the figures “6 3 9" and
substitute the figures “12.38 7.

The second] From form 3—

schedule— Omit “[five pounds and ten shil-

Part IV lings]” and substitute “[five and one-

half]”.

Omit “[two] pounds” and substi-
tute “[two]”.

From form 56—

Omit the symbol “£"” (wherever
occurring), except where occurring
before the words “ per cent”) and
substitute the symbol “$” (in each
case),

Omit the symbol “ £” where occur-
ring before the words “ per cent”.

Macquarie Water Section 19 Omit “ Threepence in the Pound ” and
Act 1892 substitute “one and a quarter cents in

the dollar ”,

Section 22| Omit “One Shilling in the Pound”
and substitute *five cents in the dol-
lar ”,

Marine Act The fourth | Omit ‘ eightpence” and substitute
1921 schedule |“ seven cents”.

Marine Board of Section 6 Omit “ Pounds” (wherever occur-
Launceston ring).

Sub-letting Act
1918

Marketing of Section 86| From subsection (1) omit ‘“ pound”
Primary and substitute “ dollar ”.

Products Act
1945

Mersey Marine Section b From subsection (6) omit *four
Board Loan Act pounds ten shillings” and substitute
1936 ‘“four and one-half 7.

Miners’ Pensions Section 15| From subsection (9) omit * three
Act 1956 pounds five shillings” and substitute

“ three and one-quarter”.
Mining Act 1929 Section 14| From subsection (2) omit “two-
pence ” and substitute “two cents”.
From subsection (4) omit “one
penny ”’ and substitute “ one cent”.

Mining The third From rule 79 omit “ pounds” (wher-
Companies schedule | ever occurring) and substitute “ dol-
Act 1884 lars ” (in each case).

Mortgage Interest |Section 4 From subsection (1) omit “four shil-
Reduction Aect lings and six pence for every pound”
19381 and substitute “ twenty-two and a half

cents for every dollar”,
From subsection (2) omit * pounds”.

Motor Vehicles The From the second column of the table
Taw Aet 1917 schedule | of seales and rates of taxes set out



1965. Decimal Currency. No. 55.
SECOND
FIRST COLUMN. COLUMN. THIRD COLUMN.
Short title of Act. Provision How amended.
under the heading “ MOTOR VEHIC-
LES OTHER THAN MOTOR CYCLES
AND TRAILERS ” omit “ five shillings
and threepence ” and substitute “ fifty-
two and a half cents”.

Mount Dundas and | Section 7 Omit “ Four-pence” and substitute
Zeehan Railway “four cents”.

Act Amendment Omit “ Three-pence” and substitute
Act (55 Viet. No. “ three cents .
22) Omit *“ Nine-pence” and substitute

“nine cents ”.

Mount Lyell and Section 29| Omit “ Four-pence” and substitute
Strahan Railway “four cents”.

Act 56 Viet— Omit “ Three-pence” and substitute
(Private) ‘“three cents ”.

Partnership Act Section 8 Omit “twenty shillings in the pound ”
1891 and substitute ‘“one hundred cents in

the dollar”.

Pawnbrokers Act Section 1 From paragraph (a) of the definition
1857 of “ pawnbroker” omit “ pounds”.

Section 5 From paragraph (e) omit “pounds ”.

Section 14| From paragraph (a) omit “ twenty
shillings, the sum of one halfpenny per
shilling ” and substitute “two dollars,
a sum equal to four per cent of the
sum advanced or lent”.

From paragraph (b) omit “twenty
shillings, the sum of one penny per
shilling ” and substitute “two dollars,
a sum equal to eight per cent of the sum
advanced or lent?”,

Section 21 From subsection (2) omit three-
pence ” and substitute “two cents”.,

Police Regulation Section 43| From subsection (1) omit “eighteen
Act 1898 pence in the pound” and substitute

“gseven and a half ecents in the dollar ”.

Psychopathic Section 4 From subsection (1) omit “ Eight
Hospital Act pounds Ten shillings per centum” and
1932 substitute “eight and one-half per

cent .

Public Service Section 2 From paragraph (b) of subsection (1)
Superannuation omit “ thirty-four pounds thirteen shil-
Fund Act 1964 lings and fourpence” and substitute

“ sixty-nine dollars thirty-three cents ”,

Racing and Section 50{ From subsection (2) omit “ pounds”.
Gaming Act Section 53| From subsection (1) omit “ pounds”.
1952 Section 54| From paragraph (a) of subsection

(1) omit “pounds” (wherever occur-
ring).

From paragraph (b) of subsection
(1) omit “pounds ten shillings” and
substitute “and one-half ”.

Section 86 From subsection (1) omit “ four shil-

lings and threepence in respect of every



No. 55.

Decimal Currency.

1965.

FirsT COLUMN.
Short title of Act.

SECOND
COLUMN.

Provision
amended.

THIRD COLUMN.

How amended.

Ringarooma Water
Loan Act 1935

Smithton
Eecreation
Ground Loan
Act 1927

Stamp Duties
Act 1931

State Advances
Act 1935

State Loans to
Local Bodies Act
1929

State Sinking Fund
Act 1929

State Teachers
Superannuation
Fund Act 1964

Strahan Marine
Board Loan Act
1963

Section 87

Section 5

Preamble
Section 4
Section 5

Section 6

Section 15

Section 7

Section 19

Section 14

Section 15

Section 17

Section 11

Section 2

Section 6

pound ” and substitute “ twenty-one and
a quarter cents in respect of each dol-
lar ”,

From paragraph (¢) of subsection (2)
omit “one penny for every five shil-
lings ” and substitute “one cent for
every fifty cents?”.

From subsection (1) omit “ two shil-
lings and six pence in the pound ” and
substitute “ twelve and a half cents in
the dollar ™.

Omit the preamble.

Omit “ Pounds ”.

Omit “ Sixpence in the pound” and
substitute “two and a half cents in
the dollar”.

From subsection (2) omit * pounds
then shillings ” and substitute “ and one-

alf ».

From subsection (2) omit “ pounds”.

From paragraph (¢) omit “twenty
shillings in the pound” and substitute
“one hundred cents in the dollar”.

From subsection (4)-—

Omit “two pounds ten shillings”
and substitute “itwo and one-half 7.
Omit “three pounds fifteen shillings ”

and”substitute “three and three-quar-
ter 7.
Omit “ pounds” (after * five”).

From paragraph (a) of subsection (1)
omit “ pounds ten shillings” and sub-
stitute “ and one-half 7,

From paragraph (b) of subsection (1)
omit “five pounds ten shillings” and
substitute “ five and one-half 7.

From subsection (2) omit “ six pounds
ten shillings” and substitute “six and
one-half ”,

From subsection (2) omit “ quarterly
at the rate of one thousand and twenty-
five pounds in respect of the four years
commencing on the first day of January
1930, and thereafter the same shall be 7.

From paragraph (b) of subsection (1)
omit ¢ thirty-four pounds thirteen shil-
lings and fourpence” and substitute
“ gixty-nine dollars thirty-three cents”.

From subsection (2) omit “ pounds”.



1965. Decimal Currency. No. 55.
SECOND
FIRST COLUMN. CoLUMN, THIRD COLUMN.
Short title of Act. fxl;xt,e‘;icslie(:irf How amended.

Strait Shipping The From the second recital omit “at a
Company Loan preamble | cost of £20,000 7,

Guarantee Act From the fourth recital omit “ the sum
1957 of £10,000” and substitute “a certain
sum ”’,

Straits Islands The Omit “1 9 (twice occurring) and
Shipping schedule | substitute “ 0.18” (in each case).
Services Omit “1 87” and substitute “0.177,
Subsidies Act
1948

Superannuation Section 4 From paragraph (b) of subsection
Act 1964 (3) omit “thirty-four pounds thirteen

shillings and fourpence ” and substitute
“ sixty-nine dollars thirty-three cents”.
Supreme Court Section 34| Omit “ pounds”.

Civil Procedure
Act 1932

Tamar Improve-
ment Act 1912

Tasmanion Aero
Club Loan
Guarantee Act
1958

Traffic Act 1925

Trustee Companies
Act 1953

Ulverstone Harbour
Trust Dissolution
Act 1962

Ulverstone Harbour
Trust Loan Act
1958

Wheat Industry
Stabilization Act
1963

Wood-pulp and
Paper Industry
Encouragement
Act 1928

Sheet 9

Section 165

Section 18

The
preamble

Section 20A

Section 18

Section 7

Section 6

Section 17

Section 8

Omit * pounds”.

From the proviso to this section omit
“ Ninepence in the Pound ” and substi-
tute “ three and three-quarter cents in
the dollar ”.

From the fifth recital omit “the sum
of £15,000” and substitute “a certain
sum of money?”.,

From the second paragraph of sub-
section (8) omit “ 0.6 of a penny ” and
substitute “one-half of a cent”.

From the second paragraph of sub-
section (4) omit “one halfpenny” and
substitute “ two-fifths of a cent”.

From paragraph (a) of subsection (1)
omit “three pounds ten shillings for
every one hundred pounds” and sub-
stitute “three and one-half per cent”.

From paragraph (b) of subsection (1)
omit “ three pounds ten shillings for
every one hundred pounds of ”” and sub-
stitute “three and one-half per cent of
the 7,

From subsection (2) omit “five
pounds ten shillings” and substitute
“five and one-half ”.

From subsection (2) omit “five
pounds ten shillings” and substitute
“five and one-half ”.

From subsection (3) omit “ twopence ”
and substitute “one and seven-tenths
cents 7,

From subsection (2)—

Onit “ Eight Pounds per centum”
(wherever occurring) and substitute
“eight per cent” (in each case).

257



268

No. 55.

Decimal Currency. 1965.

FirsT COLUMN.
Short title of Act.

SECOND
COLUMN.
Provision
amended.

THIRD COLUMN.

How amended.

Workers’
Compensation
Act 1927

Section 10

Section 12

The first
schedule

Omit “Five pounds per centum”
and substitute “five per cent”,

Omit “ One Pound or fraction of
One Pound per centum” and substi-
tute “one per cent or fraction of one
per cent”.,

From subsection (3)—

Omit “ Eight Pounds per centum”
(wherever occurring) and substitute
“eight per cent” (in each case).

From the third paragraph of sub-
section (4) omit “ Five Pounds per
centum ” and substitute “five per
cent 7.

From subsection (1) omit “Two
Pence for every Omne Pound sterling”
and substitute “ five-sixths of a cent for
every dollar ”.

From subsection (5) omit “ Two
Pounds per centum” and substitute
“two per cent”.

From sub-paragraph (i) of paragraph
(b) of sub-rule (1) of rule 1 omit
“ pounds, shillings, and pence and
adjusted to the nearest shilling” and
substitute “ dollars and cents and ad-
justed to the nearest ten cents”.

From sub-paragraph (ii) of para-
graph (b) of sub-rule (1) of rule 1
omit “ pounds, shillings, and pence and
adjusted to the nearest pound” and
substitute * dollars and cents and ad-
justed to the mearest dollar”.

Omit sub-rule (2) of rule 1 and sub-
stitute the following sub-rule: —

“(2) For the purposes of an adjust-
ment to be made under—

(a) sub-paragraph (i) of para-
graph (b) of sub-rule (1)
of this rule, if the number of
cents in any amount calcu-
lated as provided in that sub-
paragraph, when expressed in
dollars and cents, leaves an
amount of cents remaining,
if the remaining number of
cents—

(i) is less than ten cents
but not more than
five cents, the num-
ber of cents shall be
disregarded;

(ii) is less than ten cents
but more than five
cents, that amount
shall be treated as
the amount so ex-
pressed in dollars
plus ten cents;

(iii) is ten cents or a
multiple of ten cents,
that amount shall



1965. Decimal Currency. No. 55. 259

SECOND
FiesT COLUMN. COLUMN. THIRD COLUMN,
s Provision
Short title of Act, amended. How amended.

be treated as the
amount so expressed
in dollars and tens of
cents; or

(iv) is ten cents or a
multiple of ten cents
plus a further num-
ber of cents less
than ten—

(a) if the further
number of
cents is five
or less, that
amount shall
be treated
as the am-
ount so ex-
pressed in
dollars and
tens of
cents; or

(B) if the further
number of
cents ex-
ceeds five,
that amount
shall be
treated as
the amount
850 expressed
in  dollars
and tens of
cents plus
ten cents;

or

(b) sub-paragraph (ii) of that
paragraph, if the number of
cents in any amount calcu-
lated as provided in that
paragraph when expressed in
dollars and cents —

(i) does not exceed fifty,
that amount shall
be treated as the
amount so expressed
in dollars; or

(ii) exceeds fifty, that
amount shall be
treated as the
amount so expressed
in dollars plus one

dollar.”.
Workers’ (Occupa- | Section 27| From subsection (2) omit * three-
tional Diseases) pence ” and substitute “two and a half
Relief Fund Act cents 7,

1954




260

No. 55. Decimal Currency. 1965.

THE SECOND SCHEDULE.
{Section 3 (2).)
Amendments of the Crown Lands Act 1985.

1, Section 38 is amended by omitting therefrom the words “five
poun,c’ls per centum” and substituting therefor the words “five per
cent”.,

2. Section 72 is amended—

(¢) by omitting from paragraph (b) of subsection (2) thereof
the words “ one penny for every pound so in arrear for
each month for which the same has been in arrear ” and
substituting therefor the words “five per cent per
annum,”;

(b) by omitting from subsection (3) thereof the words “one
penny in the pound of the amount of purchase-money in
arrear, for every month commencing from the date when
the payment of the instalment first became due” and
substituting therefor the words “ five per cent per annum
on the amount of the purchase-money in arrear”; and

(¢) by omitting from paragraph (b) of subsection (4) thereof
the word “ pound” (twice occurring) and substituting
therefor, in each case, the word “ dollar ”.

3. The second schedule is amended by omitting therefrom the words,
figures, and symbols occurring below the word “ EXAMPLE ” and sub-
stituting therefor the following words, figures, and symbols:—

[

“Purchase price ... ... ... .. 96.00
Add one-third for eredit ... ... ... ... ... ... .. .. .. .. .. 32.00

Purchase money ... ... ... ... ... ... ... ... $128.00

Cash at time of purchase, ¥go of purchase-money .. ... ... 00.80
1st year, %28 of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... ... ... .. 1.00
2nd year, 325 of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... o o 1.00
3rd year, 1425 of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... .. . .o 1.00
4th year, Yss of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... ... .. .. 1.00
5th year, 144 of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... 0o oo 2.00
6th year, 154 of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... . o . 2.00
7th year, 144 of purchase-money ... .. .. ... ... .o o e 2.00
8th year, 144 of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... ... .. .. 2.00
9th year, 33, of purchase-money ... .. ... .. .. e e . 4.80
10th year, 349 of purchase-money ... ... ... ... .. .o e ... 4.80
11th year, 3% of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... . oo ... 4.80
12th year, 330 of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... ... .. .. 4.80
13th year, g of purchase-money 8.00
14th year, 146 of purchase-money ... ... ... .. 8.00
15th year, 146 of purchase-money 8.00
16th year, 14 of purchase-money 8.00
17th year, 3¢ of purchase-money 8.00
18th year, 146 of purchase-money 8.00
19th year, ¥s of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... ... ... .. 8.00
20th year, 14¢ of purchase-money ... ... ... ... .. . o .. 8.00
21st year, 14g of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... oo o 8.00
22nd year, g of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... .. . .. 8.00
23rd year, ¥4g of purchase-money ... ... .. ... .. ... .. .. 8.00
24th year, 3¢ of purchase-money ... ... ... ... ... ... .. .. 8.00
$128.00

and in 2 like proportion for any greater or smaller amount of purchase-
money."”.

4. The third schedule is amended by omitting therefrom the words,
figures, and symbols occurring below the word “ EXAMPLE ” and sub-
stituting therefor the following words, figures, and symbols:—



1965. Decimal Currency. No. 55.

$
“ Purchase price ... ... .... e e e e e e e e e e 99.00
Add one-third for eredit ... ... ... ... e 33.00
Purchase-money ... ... ... ... .. . o $132.00

$
Cash at time of purchase, 14 of purchase-price ... ... ... .. 3.30
1st year, 66 of residue ... ... ... ... ... o e e e 4.95
2nd year, Y6 of residue ... ... ... ... .. oo e 4.95
3rd year, 143 of such residue 9.90
4th year, %3 of such residue 9.90
5th year, %3 of such residue 9.90
6th year, %3 of such residue 9.90
Tth year, 143 of such residue 9.90
8th year, 343 of such residue 9.90
9th year, Y3 of such residue 9.90
10th year, 143 of such residue 9.90
11th year, Y3 of such residue 9.90
12th year, 343 of such residue 9.90

13th year, 143 of such residue .. 9.90
14th year, 143 of such residue 9.90
$132.00

and in”like proportion for any greater or smaller amount of purchase-
money.”,

5. The fourth schedule is amended by omitting therefrom the words,
figures, and symbols occurring below the words “(Section 36.)” and
substituting therefor the following words, figures, and symbols:—

$
“ Cash survey fee for 150 acres ... ... ... ... ... ... ... .. .. 48.00
Add one-half for credit ... ... ... ... .. 24.00
Survey Cost ... ... . o e e e 72.00

Payments. s
One-tenth on demand ... ... ... ... ... ... .. 7.20
And twenty-four annual payments of ... ... ... ... ... ... .. .. 2.70

and in like proportion for any greater or less area.”.

THE THIRD SCHEDULE.

(Section 4.)
Amendments of the Co-operative Housing Societies Act 1963.

1. Section 88 is amended by adding at the end thereof the following
subsections:—

“(5) Notwithstanding anything in the foregoing provisions of this
section, for the purpose of facilitating the transition of the business and
operations of societies from the system of the old currency to the
system of the new currency the Governor may, by regulation——

(a) prescribe tables of payments to be made for shares in
societies, expressed in terms of the new currency;

(b) make such alterations of the model rules as appear to him
to be necessary or desirable for facilitating that transi-
tion or to be necessary in consequence of the prescription
of those tables;

(¢) authorize the board of a society, with the approval of the
Registrar, to adopt such of those tables as it thinks fit,
and to adopt those alterations of the model rules; and

261



262"

No. b5. Decimal Currency. 1965.

(d) make provision for any matter that is ancillary to or
consequential upon the adoption of any such tables or
alterations of the model rules.

“(6) Subsection (4) of this section does not apply to or in relation
to an alteration of the model rules made pursuant to subsection (5) of
this section or to the adoption by a society of such an alteration.

“(7) In this section, the expressions ‘old currency’ and ‘new
currency ’ have the meanings assigned to them respectively by the
Decimal Currency Act 1965.”.

2. Section 40 is amended by adding at the end thereof the following
subsections :—

“(6) Notwithstanding anything in the foregoing provisions of this
gection or in the rules of a society, for the purpose of facilitating the
transition of the business and operations of a society from the system
of the old currency to the system of the new currency, the board of the
society may make such alterations of the rules of the society as the
board thinks necessary or desirable, and if the Registrar considers the
alterations to be necessary or desirable for that purpose he shall certify
in writing, that he is so satisfied and shall register, as prescribed, the
alterations so made.

“(7) Where the board of a society alters the rules of the society
pursuant to subsection (6) of this section it shall, within one month
after making the alteration, apply to the Registrar to have the altera-
tion registered.

“(8) Subsection (1) of this section does not apply to or in relation
to an alteration made pursuant to subsection (6) of this section.
“(9) In this section, the expressions ‘old currency’ and ‘new

currency '’ have the meanings assigned to them respectively by the
Decimal Currency Act 1965.”.

THE FOURTH SCHEDULE.
(Section 5 (7).)
Parr L.
Acts NOT AFFECTED BY SECTION 5.

City of Launceston Loans Act 1900.

City of Launceston Loans Act 1900, No. 2.

Charles Siely Pension Act 1936.

Commonwealth and State Hospital Benefits Agreement Act 19456.

Commonwealth and State Public Debt Redemption Agreement
Act 1928,

Commonwealth and State Statistical Agreement Act 1924,

Crippled Children’s Hospital (Agreements) Act 1942,

Debt Conversion Agreement Act 1931.

Debt Conversion Agreement Act (No. 2) 1931,

Devonport Corporation Act 1892.

Emu Bay Municipality Loan Act 1912.

Entertainments Tax Act 1953.

Financial Agreement Act 1927.

Financial Agreement (Soldier Settlement) Act 1934.

Financial Agreement (Variation) Act 1944.

Flinders Island Shipping Company Loan Guarantee Act 1957.

Flood Sufferers’ Relief Act 1944,

Fruitgrowers’ Defence Fund Act 1945.

George Adams Trustees Agreement Act 1944,

George Town Municipality Loan Relief Act 1937.

Glenorchy Roads Act 1933.

Hobart Corporation Loans Act 1895.

Homes (Burnie Paper Mills) Act 1938.

Housing Improvement Act 1938.

Kermandie Wood-pulp and Paper Industry Act 1933.

Kilderry Farm Gaol (Land Reservation) Act 1937.

King Island Scheelite Agreement Act 1963.



No. b55.

Decimal Currency.

1965.

King Islond Scheelite Agreement Act (No. 2) 1963.
Lake Margaret Electrical Supply Act 1927,

Land Tax Act 1957.
Land Tax Act 1958.
Land Tax Act 1959.
Land Tax Act 1960,
Land Tax Act 1961.
Land Tax Act 1962,
Land Tax Act 1963,
Land Tax Act 1964.

Launceston Sewerage Loans Act 1905.

Meercroft Home (Application of Moneys) Act 1963.
Municipal Councils Expenditure Act 1957,

Public Service Superannuation Fund Act 1957.
Public Service Superannuation Fund Act 1960.

St. Leonards Lighting Act 1925.

Sorell Railway Station Site Vesting Act 1928.

State Teachers’ Superannuation Fund Act 19517,
State Teachers’ Superannuation Fund Act 1960,
State Tourists’ Accommodation Houses Act 1927.

Tasmanian Sanatorium Act 1950.

Town of Lounceston Loans Consolidation Act 18886,

Unemployment Relief Act 1930.
Unemployment Relief Act 1932.

Unemployed (Assistance to Municipalities) Relief Act 1931.
Unemployed (Assistance to Primary Producers) Relief Act 1930.

Part II.

ProvisioNs NoT AFFECTED BY SECTION 5.

Title of Aect.

Provision unaffected.

Burnie Marine Board Loan Aet 1935

Burnie Marine Board Loan Act 1936
Christ College Act 1926

Commonwealth and State Housing Agree-
ment Act 1945

Crippled Children’s Hospital (Agreements)
Act 1942

Homes Act 1935

Hydro-Electric Commission Act 1957

Industrial Development Act 1954

Local Authorities Public Works Subsidies
Act 1936

Munnew Bequest (Application of Moneys)
Act 1958

Mount Cameron Water-race Act 1926

Plant Diseases Act 1930

Presbyterian Church Amendment Act 1908

Real Property Act 1862

State Loans to Local Bodies Act 1929

Tasmanian State School Teachers’ Federa-
tion Loan Guarantee Act 1957

Transport Act 1938

Ulverstone Harbour Trust Dissolution Act
1962

The preamble

Sections 2, 3, and 4

The first and second sched-
ules (except where specific-
ally amended in the first
schedule to this Act)

The schedule.

Section 14

Schedules (2), (3), and (4)
The schedule

The schedule

The second schedule
Section 10
The second schedule
Section 10

The preamble

The second schedule
Subsection (4) of seetion 10
Section 10

The second schedule

The third schedule

The preamble

The third schedule
Sections 5, 6, 7, 8, and 9
The schedule




