
LEGISLA:rlVE~ASSEMBLY 

(Bl'ouglitin/)Y Mr Ramsap and Bmrthwick) 

A BILL 
To amend the Hai~dressersRegislration AI:I', 

1958 and for 'other purposes . 

. BE IT ENACTED by the Queen's M.ost Excellent MajeSty by and' 
with the advice . and consent .of the .Legislative C.ouncil and 
the. Legislative Assembly .of Vict.oria.in this present Parliament 
assembled and by the authority .of the same as follows (that is t.o 

5 say): 

1. 0) This Act .1llay be cited as the Hairdress~r$. RegistrationShorl tille. 

(Amendment) Act 1980 . 

. (2~ In this Act the Haz,dressers Registration Act 1958 is ca11ed the~J~.Aclt 
Pnnclpal Act.· . . Reprinted 10 

No. 7659. 
Subsequently 
amended by 
Nos. 8427, 
8460, 8696 and 
9427. 

10 (3)This Act shall come intooperati.on on a, day .or days to be 
fixed by the proclamation or·. successive proc1amations'of the 
GClvem.oi" ill Council published in the Government. Ga~ette. 

2. Section 3 (1) ofthe'Prirtcipal Act shall be amendedasfolI.ows: tl:.egt~e~13~r 

. (a) .For 1he de,ijnjti.on of "Apprentice'; ,there ~ha:it be 
15 .substituted the foll.owing definition; 

"Apprentice'; means apprertticeWithin' the .meaning of 
section 3 of the· Industria/Training Act 1975; 

.htc....:.r338)~8S0130.10.198o-26118/80 (921) (b) In 



2 

Amendment of 
No. 6267 •• 4. 

Amendment of 
No. 6267 s. S. 

Amendment of 
No. 6267 s. 6. 

Amendment of 
No. 6267 •• 7. 

Amendment of 
No. 6267 s. 10. 

1980 Hairdressers Registration (Amendment) No. 

(b) In the definition of '''Hairdressing'' or the "practice of 
hairdressing'" the words "or the practice of hairdressing" , 
shall be repealed; 

(c) After the definition of "Prescribed" there shall be inserted 
the following definition: 5 
"Principal" includes the proprietor or the person in 

charge of any school of hairdressing or of the 
, . ,business of hairdressing conducted in any shop; 

(d) After the definition of "Register" there shall be inserted 
the following definition: 10 
"Registrar" means the registrar or deputy registrar of 

the Board. 

3. In section 4 (1) of the Principal Act for the words "registered 
masseur" there shall be substituted the words "registered 
physiotherapist". 15 

4. (1) In section 5 (2) (ba) of the Principal Act for the words "the 
Apprenticeship Commission of Victoria" there shall be substituted 
the words "the Industrial Training Commission of Victoria". 

(2) In section 5 (3) (b) of the Principal Act after the words 
"Master Ladies' Hairdressers" there shall be inserted the word 20 

. "llairworkers" . 

(3) In section 5 (14) of the Principal Act for the word "prescribed" 
there shall be substituted the words "fixed from time to time by 
the Governor in Council". 

5. In section 6 (2) (a) of the Principal Act for the words "and 25 
such" there shall be substituted the words "a deputy registrar' and 
such inspectors". 

6. For section 7 (7) of the Principal Act there shall be substituted 
the following sub-sections: 

"(3) Any copy of the register shall be prima facie evidence of the 30 
facts stated in the register and the absence (in respect of any 
prescribed class of hairdressing) of the name of a person from such a 
register shall be prima facie evidence that the person is not or was not 
registered under this Act, as the case may be. 

(4) A certificate signed by the Registrar stating that a person is or 35 
is not or was or was not registered under this Act shall be prima facie 
evidence of the facts stated in the certificate.". 

7. (1) Section 10 (2) of the Principal Act shall be amended as 
follows: 

(a) In paragraph (a) for the expression "$10" there shall be 40 
substituted the expression "$30"; 

.' (b) In 



5 

10 

15 

20 

25 

30 

40 

45 

1980 Hairdressers Registration (Amendment) No. 

(b) In paragraph (b) for the expression "$3" there shall be 
substituted the expression "$20"; 

(c) In paragraph (c) for the expression "$2" there shall be 
substituted the expression "$10". 

(2) Section 10 (4) ofthe Principal Act shall be amended as foI1ows: 
(a) For the expression "$5" (where first occurnng) there shall 

be substituted the expression" $10" and for the expression 
"$15" there shall be substituted the expression "$30"; 

(b) For the expression "$1 in the case of an employe and not 
exceeding $5 in the case of a principal or teacher" there 
shall be substituted the words "one-half of the prescribed 
fee". 

3 

8. In section 10 of the Principal Act after sub-section (8) there shall ttne6f67entl~f 
be inserted the following sub-section: o. s.. 

"(9) The Minister shall cause such report to be laid before both 
Houses of Parliament as soon as practicable.". 

9. Section 11 of the Principal Act shall be amended as follows: Amendment or 
No. 6267 s. 11. 

(a) In sub-sections (1), (2) and (3) (a) for the words "engage 
in" there shall be substituted the word "perform"; 

(b) In sub-section 3 (b) for the word "practise" there shall be 
substituted the word "perform"; 

(c) In sub-section (4)-
(i) for the words "engages in" there shall be substituted 

the word "performs"; and 
(ii) for the expression "$100" there shall be substituted 

the expression "$200". 

10. Section llA of the Principal Act shall be amended as follows: 

(a) In sub-section (1) the words "in a newspaper or other 
publication" shall be repealed; 

(b) after sub-section (2) there shall be inserted the following 
sub-section: 

"(3) In any proceedings. for an offence against 
sub-section (1) or (2) any person who appears to the 
satisfaction of the court to have advertised his willingness 
to undertake hairdressing or to have authorized such 
advertisement shall, unless he satisfies the court that 
he did not advertise or authorize the advertisement or 
he had no knowledge of such advertisement, be deemed 
to have advertised his willingness to undertake 
hairdressing." . 

11. In 

Amendment of 
No. 6267 s. llA. 



4 

Amendment of 
No. 6267 s. 14. 

Amendment of 
No. 6267 s. 16. 

Amendment of 
No. 6267 s. 17. 

1980 Hairdressers Registration (Amendment) No. 

11. In section 14 of the Principal Act for the expression "sections 
fourteen to sixteen of the Evidence Act 1958" there shall be substituted 
the expression "sections 14,15, 16, 20 and 20A of the Evidence Act 
1958 and by any rules or orders made under section 20 (4) of that 
~~ 5 

12. In section 16 (3) of the Principal Act after the expression 
"Magistrates' Courts Act 1971" there shall be inserted the expression 
"and all the provisions of the said Act". 

13. Section 17 of the Principal Act shall be amended as follows: 
(a) For the expression "(17)" there shall be substituted the 10 

expression "17 (I)"; 

(b) At the end of section 17 there shall be inserted the 
following sub-sections: 

"(2) In and for the purposes of any legal proceedings 
under or arising out of this Act the following provisions 15 
shall apply where relevant: 

(a) No proof, until evidence is given to the contrary 
shall be required-
(i) of the due constitution of the Board or the 

membership thereof; 20 
(ii) of any order or direction to prosecute or of 

the particular or general appointment of an 
inspector or officer of the Board to take 
proceedings against any person; 

(iii) of the power of any inspector or officer of 25 
the Board to prosecute; 

(iv) of the appointment of the registrar or any 
inspector or officer or servant of the Board; 

(v) of the presence of a quorum at any meeting 
of the Board at which any order or direction 30 
is made or given or any act or matter is 
done or dealt with by the Board; 

(b) The production of any document whatever 
purporting to be a document issued by the . 
Board and purporting to be certified by the 35 
Registrar of the Board to be a true copy thereof 
shall be deemed to be a true copy until the 
contrary is proved; and 

(c) The production of a copy of a document 
purporting to be confirmed minutes of a 40 
meeting of· the . Board and purporting to be 
certified by the Registrar to be a true copy 
thereof shall be evidence until the contrary be 
proved of the matters contained therein.". 

14. The 



5 

10 

15 

20 

25 

1980 Hairdressers Registration (Amendment) No. 

14. The Principal Act shall be amended as follows: Amendment of 
No. 6267 ss. 18 

(a) In section 18 (1) the expression "or of post-graduate 19 and 22. 

training in hairdressing" shall be repealed; 

(b) In section 18 (3)-

(i) for the expression "a fee of $40" there shall be 
substituted the expression "a prescribed fee not 
exceeding $250"; and 

(ii) for the expression "$10" there shall be substituted 
the expression "$20"; 

(c) In section 19 (1) the expression "or of post-graduate 
training" shall be repealed; 

(d) In sections 18 (2), 18 (3), 19 (1), 19 (4), 20 (1) (b) and (c) 
for the words "the owner or occupier" (wherever 
occurring) there shall be substituted the words "the 
Principal" ; 

(e) In section 19 (5)-
(i) for the word "Wigmakers" there shall be substituted 

the word "Hairworkers"; and 
(ii) after the words "Hairdressers Association" there 

shall be inserted the words "the Australian 
Hairdressers Wigmakers and Hairworkers 
Employees Federation (Victorian Branch)"; and 

(/) In section 20 (3) and (4) for the word "Proprietor" 
(wherever occurring) there shall be substituted the 
word "Principal". 

15. Section 21 of the Principal Act shall be amended as follows: 
(a) The words "publication and" shall be repealed; 
(b) For the words "owners or occupiers" there shall be 

substituted the words "principals". 

Amendment of 
No. 6267 s. 21. 

30 16. (1) Section 22 (1) of the Principal Act shall be amended as AmN en62dm67ent202f 
follows: o. s.. 

(a) For the expression "The Board with the approval of the 
Governor in Council" there shall be substituted the 
expression "The Governor in Council on the 

35 recommendation of the Board"; 
(b) For paragraph (a) there shall be substituted the following 

paragraph: 
"(a) regulating the proceedings of the Board;" 

(c) Paragraph (c) shall be repealed; 

(d) For 



6 1980 Hairdressers Registration (Amendment) No. 

(d) Forparagraph (/) there shall be substituted the following 
paragraph: 

"(/) prescribing the functions and duties of inspectors for 
the purposes of this Act;"; and 

(e) In paragraph (i) the words "hygiene sanitation and" shall 5 
be . repealed and after the word "and" (where second 
occurring) there shall be substituted the words 
"prescribing standards of hygiene sanitation and safety". 

(2) Section 22 (3) of the Principal Act shall be repealed. 

SaviDp. (3) All regulations made by the Board before the commencement 10 
of this section may be rescinded, revoked, amended or varied as if 
they were regulations made under section 22 of the Principal Act as 
amended by this Act and until repealed or revoked shall-

(a) continue in force; 
(b) have the like force and effect and be dealt with and 15 

enforced as if they were regulations made under section 22 
of the Pri~cipal Act as amended by this Act. 

CcmIequential 17. The Principal Act shall be amended as follows: 
amondments 
u. S.8 and 10. (a) In section 5 (1) (c) the words "in the practice or' shall 

be repealed; . 20 
(b) In section 8 (2) (b) (ii) the words "the practice or' shall 

be repealed; . . 

(c) In section 10 (4) for the word "practising" there shall 
be substituted the word "performing". 

IJr Authority: F. D. A1EDI'SON. Government Printer. Melboll1'Dll 






