10

15

LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY
Rgad 1° 5 September 1984

(Brought in by Mr Wilkes and Mr Trezise)

A BILL

To amend the Melbourne Corporation (Election of
Council) Act 1982 to enable the holding of a general
election and to provide for the fixing of the day in 1985
on which that election is to be held.

BE IT ENACTED by the Queen’s Most Excellent Majesty by
and with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and
the Legislative Assembly of Victoria in this present Parliament
assc;mbled and by the authority of the same as follows (that is to
say) :

Short title.

1. This Act may be cited as the Melbourne Corporation (Election of
Council) (Amendment) Act 1984. ‘

Commencement.

2. This Act shall come into operation on a day to be fixed by
proclamation of the Governor in Council published in the Government
Gaczette.

Principal Act.

3. In this Act the Melbourne Corporation (Election of Council) Act
1982 is referred to as the Principal Act.

9—[494]—850/5.9.84—70434/83 (Revision No. 6) (921)

Act No. 9763
amended by Nos.
9870 and 9871.



1984 Melbourne Corporation (Election of Council)  No.
(Amendment)

Election of Council for a further three year term.

4. The Principal Act shall be amended as follows:

(a) In section 2 (1) after the interpretation of “Order in Council”
there shall be inserted the following interpretation:

¢ “Prescribed” means prescribed by regulations made under
section 149 of the Local Government Act 1958 and in
force before the commencement of the Melbourne
Corporation (Election of Council) (Amendment) Act
1984 or by any regulations made under that section
after that commencement.’;

(b) In section 3 (2) for the expression “1985 there shall be
substituted the expression “1988”;

(¢) In section 24 for the expression “general election of the
council in 1985 there shall be substituted the words “next
general election”;

(d) Insection 30 (4) for the expression “sum of $50 which sum”
there shall be substituted the words “prescribed deposit
which”;

(e) In section 30 (5) for the expression “sum of $50” there shall
be substituted the words “prescribed deposit™;

(f) In section 34 for the expression “$40” there shall be
substituted the expression “10 penalty units”;

(g) In section 35 (2) (a) for the words “the general election”
there shall be substituted the words ‘““‘a general election™;

(h) In section 41 for the expression “general election of the
council in 1985 there shall be substituted the words
“holding of a general election of the council”;

(/) In sections 55 (4), 55 (6) and 56 for the expression “$200”
there shall be substituted the expression ‘10 penalty units”;

(J) In section 59 (3) for the expression “$100” there shall be
substituted the expression 10 penalty units”;

(k) In section 63 (5) for the expression “sum of $40” there shall
be substituted the expression “prescribed sum of money”;

(/) In section 64 (b) for the expression “and in 1984 there
shall be substituted the expression *, 1984, 1986 and 1987”;

(m) In section 71 (1) (a) for the expression “sum of $40” there
shall be substituted the expression “prescribed deposit”;
and

(n) Sections 73 (2), 73 (3) and 74 shall be repealed.

By Authority F D Atkinson Government Printer Melbourne

10

15

20

25

30

35



