
610 1 9 7 7 

VICTORIA. 

ment. 

ANNO VICESIMO SEXTO 

ELIZABETHS SECUNDS REGINS 

No. 9063 

An Act to amend the Constitution Act 1975 and the 
County Court Act 1958 with respect to Salaries 
of Judges. 

{19th November, 1977] 

"DE it enacted by the Queen's Most Excellent Majesty by and 
with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and the 

Legislative Assembly of Victoria in this present Parliament 
assembled and by the authority of the same as follows (that is 
to say):— 

Short title. 1. (1) This Act may be cited as the Judges Salaries Act 1977. 
Commence- (2) The scvcral provisious of this Act shall come into operation 

on a day or the respective days to be fixed by proclamation or 
successive proclamations of the Governor in Council published in 
the Government Gazette. 

Amendment of 2. Section 82 of the Constitution Act 1975 shall be amended 
l°-"'°: as f o l l o w s : -
Reprinted to 
No 8951 

{a) In sub-section (1) for the expression " $48,370" there 
shall be substituted the expression " $51,900" ; and 

(b) In sub-section (2) for the expression " $43,920 " there 
shall be substituted the expression " $47,190". 

3. Sub-section 



1977. Judges Salaries. No. 9063 gll 

3. Sub-section (1) of section 10 of the County Court Act 1958 is Amendment of 
hereby amended as follows :— R°prin«d .o 

{a) In paragraph (a) for the expression " $43,350" there ûteequlmi?'' 
shall be substituted the expression " $46,580 " ; and N"!"868ô 8̂53, 

{b) In paragraph {b) for the expression " $36,960 " there 90": ^'^' 
shall be substituted the expression " $39,820". 


