370 ’ 1968

VICTORIA.

ANNO SEPTIMO DECIMO

ELIZABETHA SECUNDAE REGIN/E

No. 7714.

An Act to increase Certain Penalties in the Margarine
Act 1958.

[6th November, 1968.]

BE it enacted by the Queens Most Excellent Majesty by and

with the advice and consent of the Legislative Council and
the Legislative Assembly of Victoria in this present Parliament
assembled and by the authority of the same as follows (that is
to say):— :

' Short title. 1. (1) This Act may be cited as the Margarine (Penalties)
Act 1968.

Principal Act (2) In this Act the Margarine Act 1958 is called the Principal
No. 6301 as ACt

amended by

Nos. 6386, 7315

and 7707. (3) The several provisions of this Act shall come into operatxon

on a day or the respective days to be fixed by proclamation or
successive proclamations of the Governor in Council pubhshed in
the Government Gazette.

Amendments 2. The Principal Act shall be amended as follows :—
of Mo S30. (@) In sub-section (2) of section 4—
5. 4. (i) for the expression “ $200” there shall be

substituted the expression “ $500”° ; and

(ii) for the expression  $40” there shall be
substituted the expression “ $100 .

®) In



1968. - - Margarine (Penalties). No. 7714. 371 .

() In sub-section (2) of section 9— ) 5.9 .
(i) for the expression “ $200” there shall be
substituted the expression “$500”’; and

(ii) for the expression * $40” there shall be
substituted the expression ““ $100 .



