746 Children’s Health Camps Amendment 1983, No. 65

ANALYSIS
Title 2. Interpretation
1. Short Title 3. Unauthorised expenditure
1983, No. 65

An Act to amend the Children’s Health Camps Act 1972
(12 December 1983

BE IT ENACTED by the General Assembly of New Zealand
in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as
follows:

1. Short Title—This Act may be cited as the Children’s
Health Camps Amendment Act 1983, and shall be read
together with and deemed part of the Children’s Health Camps
Act 1972 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act).

2. Interpretation—(1) Section 2 of the principal Act is
hereby amended by repealing the definition of the expression
“financial year”.

(2) Notwithstanding subsection (1) of this section or anything
in the principal Act, the period commencing on the 1st day
of August 1983 and ending with the 31st day of March 1984
shall be deemed to be a financial year.

(3) Section 34 (5) of the principal Act is hereby amended by
omitting the expression “31st day of October”, and substituting
the expression “30th day of June”.

(4) Subsections (1) and (3) of this section shall come into force
on the Ist day of April 1984.



1983, No. 65 Children’s Health Camps Amendment 747

3. Unauthorised expenditure—Section 33 of the principal
Act is hereby amended by omitting the expression “$200”,
and substituting the expression “$500”.

This Act 1s administered in the Department of Health.




