[As ReporTED FroM THE LANDS AND AGRIGULTURE
COMMITTEE |

House of Representatives, 29 July 1980.

Words struck out are shown in italics within bold round
brackets, or with black rule at beginning and after last line;
words inserted are shown in roman underlined with a double
rule, or with double rule before first line and after last line.

Right Hon. Mr MacIntyre

HYDATIDS AMENDMENT

ANALYSIS

5. Appeal against requirement relating
to dog-proof killing facility

Title 6. Hydatids control fees increased
1. Short Title and commencement 7. Offences
2. Interpretation 8. Circumstances in which permit may
3. Act to bind the Crown be granted allowing untreated
4. Provision of dog-proof killing meat to be fed to dogs
facility 9. Penalties increased

A BILL INTITULED
An Act to amend the Hydatids Act 1968

BE IT ENACTED by the General Assembly of New Zea-
land in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the
5 same, as follows:

1. Short Title and commencement— (1) This Act may be
cited as the Hydatids Amendment Act 1980, and shall be read
together with and deemed part of the Hydatids Act 1968%
(hereinafter referred to as the principal Act).

10 (2) This Act shall come into force on the 1st day of
January 1981,

2. Interpretation—Section 2 of the principal Act is hereby
amended—
(a) By inserting, in the definition of the term “disposal
15 unit”, after the words “raw offal” in both places
where they occur, the words “or untreated sheep
or goat meat or both such offal and meat’:

*Reprinted 1976, Vol. 5, p. 3917

No. 20—2
Price 20¢



2 Hydatids Amendment

(b) By inserting, after the definition of the term “disposal
unit”, the following definition:

“ ‘Dog -proof killing facility’ means any enclosure,
building, structure, or other facility where
the killing of stock takes place and which—

“(a) Includes a disposal unit or a treat-
ment unit; and
“(b) Is constructed in such a way that a
dog cannot enter:”
(c) By repealing the definition of the term “treatment
unit”’, and substituting the following definition:

“ “Treatment unit’ means any apparatus that is
capable of being used for treating raw offal
or untreated sheep or goat meat or both such
offal and meat:”.

3. Act to bind the Crown—The principal Act is hereby
amended by inserting, after section 2, the following section:
“2a. This Act shall bind the Crown.”

4. Provision of dog-proof killing facility— (1) Section 30
(1) of the principal Act is hereby amended by inserting,
after paragraph (c), the following paragraph:

“(ca) Where the killing of animals is to continue on the
property and hydatids has been found, within the
previous 12 months, {twice in any dog or once in
any 2 or more dogsl in any dog or other animal

that is or has been kept there, to give notice

requiring the owner or occupier of the property
to provide a dog-proof killing facility on that
property:”.

(2) Section 30 (1) of the principal Act is hereby further
amended by omitting from paragraph (d) the words ‘“or
treatment unit”, and substituting the words “, treatment unit,
or dog-proof killing facility”.

5. Appeal against requirement relating to dog- proof killing

10

15

20

25

30

facility—Section 31 (1) of the pr1nc1pal Act is hereby 35

amended by msertmg, after the express1on “paragraph (c)”

the expression “or paragraph (ca)”. ’




Hydatids Amendment 3

6. Hydatids control fees increased—(1) Section 32 (1) of
the principal Act (as substituted by section 9 (1) of the
Hydatids Amendment Act 1972) is hereby amended by omit-
ting from the proviso the expression “$10” (as substituted

3 by section 11 of the Hydatids Amendment Act 1975), and
substituting the expression “$15”.

(2) Section 32 (1a) of the principal Act (as substituted
by section 9 (1) of the Hydatids Amendment Act 1972) is
hereby amended by omitting from paragraph (a) the expres-

10 sion “$10”, and substituting the expression “$20”.
New

(3) Section 11 of the Hydatids Amendment Act 19757;

hereby consequentially repealed.
It 1

7. Offences—
15 Struck Out

j (1) Section 43 (1) (b) of the principal Act
(as substituted by section 10 (1) of the Hydatids Amendment
Act 1972) is hereby amended by inserting, after the word
“any”, the words “raw offal or”.
| .

20 New

(1) Section 43 of the principal Act is hereb;
amended by repealing subsection (1) (as substituted by
section 10 (1) of the Hydatids Amendment Act 1972), and
substituting the following subsection:

25  “(1) Every person commits an offence, and is liable on
summary conviction to a fine not exceedmg $500, who—

“(a) Feeds or causes to be fed to any dog any offal or
sheep or goat meat knowing that offal to be raw
offal or that meat to be untreated sheep or goat

30 meat; or

“(b) Sells or exposes for sale any offal or meat for feed-
ing to dogs knowing that offal to be raw offal
or that meat to be untreated sheep or goat meat;
or

35  “(c) By himself, his employee, or agent, without just

cause or excuse,—
“(1) Knowingly leaves the carcass of any animal
to lie about in the open; or
“(ii) Does or omits to do any act that enables
40 any dog to obtain access to any raw offal or any

untreated sheep or goat meat.”
L& 1y




4 Hydatids Amendment

(2) Section 43 (3) of the principal Act is hereby amended
by repealing paragraph (b), and substituting the following
paragraph:

“(b) Fails within 1 month to comply with any notice under

paragraph (c) or paragraph (ca) or paragraph
(d) of section 30 (1) or under section 31 (5) of
this Act:”.

(3) Section 4 (b) of the Hydatids Amendment Act 1971
is hereby repealed.

8. Circumstances in which permit may be granted allow-
ing untreated meat to be fed to dogs—Section 43 (1a) of
the principal Act (as substituted by section 10 (1) of the
Hydatids Amendment Act 1972) is hereby amended—

(a) By omitting the words ‘mustering sheep”, and substi-
tuting the words “mustering operatlons or wild
animal control operations under the Wild Animal
Control Act 1977”:

(b) By inserting, after the word “muster”, in each place
where it occurs, the words “or wild animal control
operation”.

9. Penalties increased—
Struck Out

(1) Section 43 (1) of the princi-
pal Act (as substituted by section 10 (1) of the Hydatids
Amendment Act 1972) is hereby amended by omitting the
express1on “$400”, and substituting the expression “$5007.

(2) Section 43 (3) of the principal Act is hereby amended
by omitting the expression “$100”, and substituting the
expression “$200”.

(3) Section 46 (2) (f) of the principal Act is hereby
amended by omitting the expression “$40”, and substituting
the expression “$100”.

WELLINGTON, NEW ZEALAND: Printed under the authority of the New Zealand
Government by P. D. HasseLBERG, Government Printer—1980

10

15

20

25

30



