
1 AS REPORTED FROM THE LOCAL BILLS COMMITTEE.]
House of Repre0entatives, Sth December, 1937.

Mr. Barrell.

HAMILTON BOROUGH COUNCIL EMPOWERING
AMENDMENT.

Title.
Preamble.

1. Short Title.

[LOCAL BILL.]

ANALYSIS.

1 2.Section 2 of the Hamilton

Borough Council Empowering
Act, 1935, amended.

A BILL INTITITLED

AN AcT to amend the Hamilton Borough Council Title.
Empowering Act, 1935.

WHEREAS by the Hamilton Borough Council Preamble.
5 Empowering Act, 1935 (hereinafter called the principal

Act), the Hamilton Borough Council (hereinafter called
the Council) is empowered to acquire certain lands in
the Borough of Hamilton: And whereas by section two
of the principal Act the time within which such power

10 may be exercised is limited to two years from the
passing of the principal Act, being the twenty-sixth day
of October, nineteen hundred and thirty-five: And
whereas it has been found impossible to carry out all
necessary formalities within the time limited as afore-

15 said: And whereas it is desirable that the time within

which the powers conferred on the Council by the
principal Act may be extended:

No'.' 28L_2



Short Title.

Section 2 of

tlie IIamilton

Borough
Council

Enipowering
Aet, 1935,
amended.

Period

limited by
section 2

of principal
Act extended.

2 Hamilton Borough Council Empowering
Amendment

BE IT THEREFORE ENACTED by the General Assembly
of New Zealand in Parliament assembled, and by the
authority of the same, as follows:-

1. This Act may be cited as the Hamilton Borough
Council Empowering Amendment Act, 1937, and shall be 5
read together w Wh and deemed part of the Hamilton
Borough Coun©il Empowerint,g Act, 1935.

Struck out.

2. Section two of the principal Act is hereby amended
by omitting the words " two years ", and substituting 10
 the words " three years ".

New.

2x. (1) Notwithstanding the provisions of section two
of the principal Act, the powers and authorities conferred
on the Council by that section may be exercised at any 15
time within four years from the twenty-sixth day of
October, nineteen hundred and thirty-five (being the
date of the passing of the principal Act), and all the
provisions of that Act shall apply in all respects as if
the period limited by the said section two had been 20
four years and not two years.

(2) The said section two is hereby consequentially
amended by omitting the words " two years ", and
substituting the words " four years ".

By Authority: E. V. PAUL, Government Printer, Wellington.-1937.


