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A BILL INTITULED

An Act to amend the Summit Road (Canterbury) Protection
Act 1963.

BE IT ENACTED by the General Assembly of New Zealand
5 in Parliament assembled, and by the authority of the same, as

follows:

1. Short Title-This Act may be cited as the Summit Road
(Canterbury) Protection Amendment Act 1973, and shall be
read together with and deemed part of the Summit Road

10 (Canterbury) Protection Act 1963 (hereinafter referred to
as the principal Act).

New

' 1A. Interpretation-Subsection (1 ) of section 2 of the
principal Act is hereby amended by adding to the definition

15 of the term "structure" the words ". and also includes any
building or other structure proposed to be erected, repaired,
modified, or extended by the Crown in respect of which
such a permit would be required if the erection, repair,
modification, or extension were to be carried out otherwise

20 than by the Crown".
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2 Summit Road.(Canterbury) Protection Amendment

2. Area to which Act applies-Section 4 of the principal
Act is hereby amended by omitting from subsection (1) the
words "coloured red or blue" ( as substituted by section 2 of
the Summit Road (Canterbury) Protection Amendment Act
1965), and substituting the words "coloured red, blue, or 5
yellow".

3. Crown bound-The principal Act is hereby further
amended by repealing section #A (as inserted by section 3 of
the Summit Road (Canterbury) Protection Amendment Act
1965), and substituting the following section: 10

"4A. Crown bound-This Act shall bind the Crown."

4. Repeal-The Summit Road (Canterbury) Protection
Amendment Act 1965 is hereby consequentially repealed.

WELLINGTON, NEW ZEALAND: Printed under the authority of the -New. Zealand
Government, by A. R. SHEARER, Government Printer-1973


