
388 

In witness whereof the seal of the Court of Arbitration hath hereto been affixed, 
and the Judge of the Court hath hereunto set his hand, this 29th day of April 1968. 

[LS.] A P. BLAIR, Judge. 

M EMORANDUM 

The award, including the operative date of provisions relating to wages, incor­
porates the terms of settlement arrived at by the parties in the course of an inquiry 
held before a Council of Conciliation. The unqualified preference provision ( clause 
15) has been inserted in accordance with the agreement of all the assessors. 

A P. BLAIR, Judge. 

NORTHLAND, THAMES, TAURANGA, BAY OF PLENTY, OPOTIKI, TAUMARUNUI, 
WAIAPU HOSPITAL BOARDS' CLERICAL AND OTHER WORKERS-VARIATION 
OF INDUSTRIAL AGREEMENT 

THIS industrial agreement made in pursuance of the Industrial Conciliation and 
Arbitration Act, 1954 this 22nd day of March 1968 between the Northland, 
Thames, Tauranga, Bay of Plenty, Opotiki, Taumarunui, Waiapu Hospital Boards 
and the Auckland Provincial District Local Authorities' Officers Industrial Union 
of Workers, whereby it is mutually agreed by and between the said parties that the 
industrial agreement made between the parties on the 1st day of September, 1966 
as amended on the 20th day of October, 1967 shall be and is hereby further varied 
in the manner following: 

(i) That clause I (b) be amended by deleting the amount '$3540' and sub­
stituting '$3620 from I April 1967' and '$3700 from I April 1968'. 

That clause I (c) be amended by deleting the amount '$3810' and substituting 
'$3920 from I April 1967' and '$4020 from 1 April 1968'. 

Clause I (d) be amended by deleting the amount '$2860' and substituting '$2890 
from I April 1967' and '$2920 from 1 April 1968'. 

(ii) (a) That clause 3 (a) be amended by deleting the salary specified against the 
thirteenth year of service therein ($2460) and substituting as under: 

3 (a) Administrative-
Grade I-

Rate per Annum Effective 
tfrom 

1/4/1967 
$2470 

1/4/1968 
$2480 

Grade 2- Male Officers-
Delete '$3810' and '$3540' and substitute '$3920' and '$3620' respectively 

from 1 April 1967 and '$4020' and '$3700' respectively from I April 1968. 
( b) That clause 3 ( c) be amended as follows : 

Clause 3 (c)-Female Officers Grade 2-
Delete '$2860' and substitute '$2890 from I April 1967' and '$2920 from 

1 April 1968'. 
(iii) That clause 6 (b) be amended by deleting the amount '$3390' and sub­

stituting '$3460 from 1 April 1967' and '$3530 from 1 April 1968'. 
The amendments provided for in the above clauses shall be deemed to come into 

force on the dates specified therein. 



389 

Signed on behalf of the Northland, Thames, Tauranga, Bay of Plenty, Opotiki, 
Taumarunui and Waiapu Hospital Boards-

A. G. WILSON, Assessor. 
A. J. REGAN, Assessor. 

Signed on behalf of the Auckland Provincial District Local Authorities' Officers 
Industrial Union of Workers-

J. W. MADDEN, President. 

GUARDIAN CEMENT COMPANY LIMITED, CAPE FOULWIND DRIVERS AND 
OPERATORS-INDUSTRIAL AGREEMENT 

Tms industrial agreement made in pursuance of the Industrial Conciliation and 
Arbitration Act, 1954, this 24th day of April 1968, between the Westland Road 
Transport and Motor and Horse Drivers' and their Assistants Industrial Union of 
Workers (hereinafter called "the union"), of the one part and Guardian Cement 
Company Limited, Cape Foulwind, (hereinafter called "the Employer") of the 
other part, whereby it is mutually agreed by and between the parties hereof as 
follows, that is to say: 

1. That the terms, conditions, stipulations and provisions contained and set 
out in the schedule hereto shall be binding upon the said parties, and they shall be 
deemed to be and are 1hereby incorporated in and declared to form part of this 
agreement. 

2. The said parties hereto shall respectively do, observe and perform every 
matter and thing by this agreement and by the said terms, conditions, stipulations 
and provisions respectively required to be done, observed and performed, and shall 
not do anything in contravention of this agreement or of the said terms, conditions, 
stipulations, and provisions, but shall in all respects abide by and perform the same. 

Clause 1. Hours of Work 
(a) Except as hereinafter provided, the ordinary hours of work shall not exceed 

40 per week, or 8 hours per day to be worked between 7 a.m. and 5 p.m. from 
Monday to Friday. Both days inclusive. 

(b) The daily hours shall be continuous, except for meal intervals. 
( c) No worker shall work more than 5 hours continuously without an interval of 

at least half an hour for a meal. 

Clause 2. Shift Workers 
(a) The ordinary hours of work of shift workers shall not exceed 8 hours on five 

days of the week, Monday to Friday, both days inclusive, to be worked between 
the hours of 7 a.m. and midnight. 

Shift hours to be as follows: 
1st Shift (day shift)-7 a.m.-3.30 p.m 
2nd Shift (afternoon shift)-3.30 p.m.-Midnight. 

(b) Men employed on shift work shall not be called upon to work two weeks 
consecutively, on the afternoon shift, except in cases of emergency, when work may 
be carried on as required. 

(c) "Week" means the period from midnight Saturday up to and including 
midnight on the following Saturday. 



1845 

MEMORANDUM 

The award, including the operative date of prov1s10ns relating to wages, 
incorporates the terms of settlement arrived at by the parties in the course of 
an inquiry held before a Council of Conciliation. The unqualified preference pro­
vision (clause 18) has been inserted in accordance with the agreement of all 
the assessors. A provision ( clause 3) has been included in the award for the 
purpose of giving operative effect to the Court's general order of 5 August 1968. 

J. B. THOMSON' Judge. 

NORTHLAND, THAMES, TAURANGA, BAY OF PLENTY, OPOTIKI, TAUMARUNUI, 
WAIAPU HOSPITAL BOARDS' CLERICAL AND omER WORKERS'-VARIATION 

OF INDUSTRIAL AGREEMENT 
THIS Industrial Agreement made in pursuance of the Industrial Conciliation and 
Arbitration Act, 1954 this 8th day of October 1968. 

Between the Northland, Thames, Tauranga, Bay of Plenty, Opotiki, Taumarunui, 
Waiapu Hospital Boards and the Auckland Provincial District Local Authorities' 
Officers Industrial Union of Workers. 

Whereby it is mutually agreed by and between the said parties that the industrial 
agreement made between the parties on the 1st day of September, 1966 as amended 
on the 20th day of October 1967 and 22nd day of March 1968 shall be and is 
hereby further varied in the manner following: 

(i) Clause 1 (b) be amended by deleting '$3,620 from 1 April 1967' and 
substituting '$3,650 from 1 August 1967' and by deleting the figure 
of '$3,700' and substituting '$3,730'. 

Clause 1 (c) be amended by deleting '$3,920 from 1 April 1967' and 
substituting '$3,950 from 1 August 1967' and by deleting the figure of 
'$4,020' and substituting '$4,050'. 

Clause 1 (d) be amended by deleting '$2,890 from 1 April 1967' and 
substituting '$2,920 from 1 August 1967' and by deleting the figure 
'$2,920' and substituting '$2,950'. 

(ii) Clauses 3 (a), (b), (c) and (d) be amended by deleting all rates of salary 
specified therein and substituting as under: 

3. (a) Administrative 
Grade 1 

First year 
Second year 
Third year 
Fourth year 
Fifth year 
Sixth year 
Seven th year 
Eighth year 
Ninth year 
Tenth year 
Eleventh year 
Twelfth year ... ... 
Thirteenth year 

1 August 1967 
$ 

945 
1,100 
1,257 
1,422 
1,581 
1,752 
1,890 
2,080 
2,170 
2,233 
2,324 
2,408 
2,500 

Rate Per 
Annum 

Effective 
From 

1 April 1968 
$ 

2,510 



Grade 2-Male Officers 
Maximum salary per annum 

1846 

Northland and Tauranga Hospital Boards-$3,950 from 1 August 1967 
$4,050 from 1 April 1968 

Other Hospital Boards party to this agreement-$3,650 from 1 August 1967 
$3,730 from 1 April 1968 

Clause 3 (b) (1)-$2,324 from 1 August 1967 
Clause 3 (b) (2)-$2,408 from 1 August 1967 

Clause 3 (c) Female Officers 
Grade 1 

First year 
Second year ... ... 
Third year 
Fourth year ..... . 
Fifth year 
Sixth year 
Seventh year ..... . 
Eighth year ..... . 

Clause 3 (c) Female Officers­
Grade 2 

Rate Per Annum 
E:ffecti ve From 
1 August 1967 

$ 
945 

1,100 
1,257 
1,422 
1,581 
1,752 
1,890 
1,985 

Maximum salary per annum-$2,920 from 1 August 1967 
$2,950 from 1 April 1968 

Clause 3 (d)-$1 ,890 
(iii) Clause 6 (b) be amended by deleting all words and figures following 'shall 

not exceed ...... ' and substituting '$3,490 effective 1 August 1967 
and $3,560 effective 1 April 1968'. 

The amendments provided for in the above clauses shall be deemed to come 
into force on the dates specified therein. 

Signed: on behalf of the Northland, Thames, Tauranga, Bay of Plenty, Opotiki .. 
Taumarunui and Waiapu Hospital Boards-

A. G. WILSON, Assessor. 
A. J. REGAN, Assessor. 

Signed: on behalf of the Auckland Provincial District Local Authorities' Officers. 
Industrial Union of Workers-

J. W. MADDEN, President. 

NEW ZEALAND PAPER MILLS LTD., (MATAURA) CARPENTERS-INDUSTRIAL 
AGREEMENT 

Tms industrial agreement made in pursuance of the Industrial Conciliation and 
Arbitration Act 1954, this 1st day of October 1968 between the New Zealand 
Carpenters and Related Trades Industrial Union of Workers, (hereinafter referred 
to as "the union") , of the one part and the N.Z. Paper Mills Ltd., Mataura (herein­
after referred to as "the employer"), of the other part, whereby it is mutually agreed 
by and between the said parties hereto as follows, that is to say: 

1. That the terms, conditions, stipulations, and provisions contained and set out 
in the Schedule hereto shall be binding upon the said parties and they shall be 
deemed to be and are hereby incorporated in and declared to form part of this 
agreement. 



1952 

The special grounds stated in accordance with regulation 4 (3) are common 
to each application, and are to the effect that exclusion from the operation of the 
general order of the Court is necessary because it has been agreed by the respective 
parties that the wage or salary rates to be paid by the authorities concerned shall 
be related to the rates operating in the State Services and shall be amended from 
time to time to reflect any variations made by the State Services Commission 
following ruling rates surveys taken under section 42 of the State Services Act 1962. 

J.B. THOMSON, Judge. 

NORTHLAND, THAMES, TAURANGA, BAY OF PLENTY, OPOTIKI, TAUMARUNUI, 
WAIAPU HOSPITAL BOARDS' CLERICAL AND OTHER WORKERS'- VARIATION 

OF INDUSTRIAL AGREEMENT 
THIS industrial agreement made in pursuance of the Industrial Conciliation and 
Arbitration Act, 1954 this 22nd day of November 1968. 

Between the Northland, Thames, Tauranga, Bay of Plenty, Opotiki, Taumarunui, 
Waiapu Hospital Boards and the Auckland Provincial District Local Authorities' 
Officers Industrial Union of Workers. 

Whereby it is mutually agreed by and between the said parties that the industrial 
agreement made between the parties on the l'S:t day of September, 1966 as amended 
on the 20th day of October 1967, 22nd day of March 1968 and 8th day of 
October 1968 shall be and is hereby further varied in manner following: 

(i) Clause 3-Rates and Conditions of Pay-Insert new sub-clause-
(q) Pursuant to sub-clause (f) hereof and pending the determination of the 

State Services Commission as a result of a Ruling Rate Survey to be conducted 
in February 1969, the rates of remuneration provided for in clauses ( 1) and (3) 
and paid to employees to whom this industrial agreement applies shall be increased 
in accordance with the following table: 

Present Salary 
From To Annual 

$ $ $ 
2,080 4,050 84 
1,666 2,079 73 
1,410 1,665 63 
1,153 1,409 52 

897 1,152 42 
Provided however that this interim adjustment does not attract overtime and 

penal payments nor affect any allowances provided for in this agreement. 
(ii) The amendments provided herein shaU be deemed to have come into force 

on the 19th day of August, 1968. 
Signed on behalf of the Northland, Thames, Tauranga, Bay of Plenty, Opotiki, 

Taumarunui and Waiapu Hospital Boards. 
A. G. WILSON, Assessor. 
A. J. REGAN, Assessor. 

Signed on behalf of the Auckland Provincial District Local Authorities' Officers 
Industrial Union of Workers. 

J.B. DAVY. 




